From: Conley, Ryan E.

To: Davis, Pamela K.
Cc: Popp, Susan J.; Miller, Robert “Mike”; Hughes, David W.; Burke, Sue A.; Wentzel, Trisha L.; Fennell, Daniel W.
Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks
Date: Friday, September 23, 2022 3:05:31 PM
Attachments: image003.png
imaae004.png

Price projections shown in green.

| still have yet to receive actual prices from Byers for clarification. These are the estimated prices
with contingencies.

DOP Strings

E transit for meter group $65,000
60-6007-06-66520-6300-000000-DU001-600715

E transit for substation group $80,0000
60-6007-06-66520-6300-000000-EL001-600708

DOW strings

HCWP F250 $60,000

60-6009-06-66520-6000 -000000-WT002-600902
Watershed F350 $70,000

60-6009-06-66520-6000 -000000-WT002-600904
Watershed F450 $75,000

60-6009-06-66520-6000 -000000-WT002-600904

From: Davis, Pamela K.

Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022 2:51 PM

To: Conley, Ryan E. <REConley@columbus.gov>

Cc: Popp, Susan J. <SJPopp@Columbus.gov>; Miller, Robert “Mike” <RMMiller@columbus.gov>;
Hughes, David W. <DWHughes@columbus.gov>; Burke, Sue A. <SABurke@columbus.gov>; Wentzel,
Trisha L. <TLWentzel@columbus.gov>; Fennell, Daniel W. <DWFennell@columbus.gov>

Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks

Importance: High

How much money for each string?

From: Conley, Ryan E.

Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022 1:53 PM

To: Davis, Pamela K. <PKDavis@columbus.gov>

Cc: Popp, Susan J. <SJPopp@Columbus.gov>; Miller, Robert “Mike” <RMMiller@columbus.gov>;
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Hughes, David W. <DWHughes@columbus.gov>; Burke, Sue A. <SABurke@columbus.gov>; Wentzel,
Trisha L. <TLWentzel@columbus.gov>; Fennell, Daniel W. <DWFennell@columbus.gov>
Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks

Here you go, sorry for the delay, | had to find this information for Water.
DOP Strings

E transit for meter group
60-6007-06-66520-6300-000000-DU001-600715

E transit for substation group
60-6007-06-66520-6300-000000-EL0O01-600708

DOW strings

HCWP F250

60-6009-06-66520-6000 -000000-WT002-600902
Watershed F350

60-6009-06-66520-6000 -000000-WT002-600904
Watershed F450

60-6009-06-66520-6000 -000000-WT002-600904

From: Davis, Pamela K.

Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022 11:08 AM
To: Conley, Ryan E. <REConley@columbus.gov>
Cc: Popp, Susan J. <SJPo Columbus.gov>
Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks

Importance: High

Please provide DAX Strings for all of the vehicles.

From: Davis, Pamela K.

Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022 10:05 AM
To: Conley, Ryan E. <REConley@columbus.gov>
Cc: Popp, Susan J. <SJPo Columbus.gov>
Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks

It depends on when the legislation passes.

From: Conley, Ryan E.

Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022 10:02 AM
To: Davis, Pamela K. <PKDavis@columbus.gov>
Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks
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Sorry for all the confusion and questions, | am still trying to get a grip on the process.

Once the ordering bank opens up in middle October, can | purchase these items we have been
working on? Or do | get the hard quotes from Ford, send Jon the actual amounts needed before we
process through DAX?

| was reluctant to send him an email with projected costs, which is why | am asking the correct way
to handle this.

Also when sending him the amounts, | would assume to include each DAX string for individual items
would be expected, correct?

Again, sorry for all the questions, | still have my training wheels on!

Thanks Pam!

From: Davis, Pamela K.

Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022 9:55 AM

To: Conley, Ryan E. <REConley@columbus.gov>
Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks

You will need to tell him the final amounts for the purchases & that it needs to be Emergency
Legislation.

From: Conley, Ryan E.

Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022 9:40 AM

To: Davis, Pamela K. <PKDavis@columbus.gov>
Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks

Pam,

| have started a draft email to Jon Lee. Do I still need to send him this info regarding these
purchases?

From: Davis, Pamela K.

Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022 9:20 AM

To: Conley, Ryan E. <REConley@columbus.gov>; Fennell, Daniel W. <DWFennell@columbus.gov>
Cc: Popp, Susan J. <SJPopp@Columbus.gov>; Burke, Sue A. <SABurke@columbus.gov>; Hughes,
David W. <DWHughes@columbus.gov>; Miller, Robert “Mike” <RMMiller@columbus.gov>; Wentzel,
Trisha L. <TLWentzel@columbus.gov>

Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks

Does the amounts include the contingency amount?
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From: Conley, Ryan E.
Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022 9:12 AM
To: Davis, Pamela K. <PKDavis@columbus.gov>; Fennell, Daniel W. <DWFennell@columbus.gov>

Cc: Popp, Susan J. <SJPopp@Columbus.gov>; Burke, Sue A. <SABurke@columbus.gov>; Hughes,
David W. <DWHughes@columbus.gov>; Miller, Robert “Mike” <RMMiller@columbus.gov>; Wentzel,
Trisha L. <TLWentzel@columbus.gov>

Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks

All,

After discussion with Dan, | have to correct the price suggestions
DOW

F250- 60,000

F350- 70,000

FA50- 75,000

DOP

The suv was denied by the directors office.

We will be purchasing two E Transits

1- 64,000
2- 80,000

| hope this is helpful.

From: Davis, Pamela K.

Sent: Thursday, September 22, 2022 3:13 PM

To: Fennell, Daniel W. <DWFennell@columbus.gov>; Conley, Ryan E. <REConley@columbus.gov>
Cc: Popp, Susan J. <SJPopp@Columbus.gov>; Burke, Sue A. <SABurke@columbus.gov>; Hughes,
David W. <DWHughes@columbus.gov>; Miller, Robert “Mike” <RMMiller@columbus.gov>; Wentzel,
Trisha L. <TLWentzel@columbus.gov>

Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks

I will need to know the Brass Tag#'s that this money will be replacing.

From: Fennell, Daniel W.
Sent: Thursday, September 22, 2022 3:08 PM
To: Conley, Ryan E. <REConley@columbus.gov>; Davis, Pamela K. <PKDavis@columbus.gov>

Cc: Popp, Susan J. <SJPopp@Columbus.gov>; Burke, Sue A. <SABurke@columbus.gov>; Hughes,
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David W. <DWHughes@columbus.gov>; Miller, Robert “Mike” <RMMiiller@columbus.gov>; Wentzel,
Trisha L. <TLWentzel@columbus.gov>
Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks

Pam,

Just want to verify with Ryan about the vehicles being purchased before entering these.
DOW

F250 - $60,000

F350 - $65,000

FA50 - $55,000

DOP
SUV - $45,000

These are what | would recommend.

DANIEL W. FENNELL
FLEET COORDINATOR

THE CITY OF

COLUMBUS

REW J. GINTHER, MAYOR

DEPARTMENT OF
PUBLIC UTILITIES

DIVISION OF SEWERAGE AND DRAINAGE
1250 FAIRWOOD AVENUE

COLUMBUS, OH 43206

DIRECT: 614.645.6407

CELL: 614.561.1765

HTTP://COLUMBUS.GOV/

From: Conley, Ryan E.

Sent: Thursday, September 22, 2022 7:15 AM

To: Davis, Pamela K. <PKDavis@columbus.gov>; Fennell, Daniel W. <DWFennell@columbus.gov>

Cc: Popp, Susan J. <SJPopp@Columbus.gov>; Burke, Sue A. <SABurke@columbus.gov>; Hughes,
David W. <DWHughes@columbus.gov>; Miller, Robert “Mike” <RMMiller@columbus.gov>; Wentzel,
Trisha L. <TLWentzel@columbus.gov>

Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks

Sorry for the slow response on these emails. | have been out of the office unexpectedly. | have
emails out to our Ford vendor attempting to get rough quotes on SuperDuty vehicles we need. Once
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I have those, | can provide the amount needed for legislation. Dan, since you are in a similar spot,
would you recommend a certain dollar figure for our vehicles? i have attached the budgets for
Power, and Water for you to see what we are looking at. Power has Two different E Transits waiting
on quotes. Water has three Super Duty vehicles that need quotes. Again sorry for getting back so
late.

From: Davis, Pamela K.
Sent: Thursday, September 22, 2022 7:06 AM
To: Fennell, Daniel W. <DWFennell@columbus.gov>; Conley, Ryan E. <REConley@columbus.gov>

Cc: Popp, Susan J. <SJPopp@Columbus.gov>; Burke, Sue A. <SABurke@columbus.gov>; Hughes,
David W. <DWHughes@columbus.gov>; Miller, Robert “Mike” <RMMiller@columbus.gov>; Wentzel,

Trisha L. <TLWentzel@columbus.gov>
Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks

Yes

From: Fennell, Daniel W.

Sent: Wednesday, September 21, 2022 2:44 PM

To: Davis, Pamela K. <PKDavis@columbus.gov>; Conley, Ryan E. <REConley@columbus.gov>

Cc: Popp, Susan J. <SJPopp@Columbus.gov>; Burke, Sue A. <SABurke@columbus.gov>; Hughes,
David W. <DWHughes@columbus.gov>; Miller, Robert “Mike” <RMMiller@columbus.gov>; Wentzel,
Trisha L. <TLWentzel@columbus.gov>

Subject: RE: Light Duty Trucks

Pam,
Is this for DOW and DOP?

Dan

From: Davis, Pamela K.

Sent: Wednesday, September 21, 2022 11:17 AM

To: Fennell, Daniel W. <DWFennell@columbus.gov>; Conley, Ryan E. <REConley@columbus.gov>
Cc: Popp, Susan J. <SJPopp@Columbus.gov>; Burke, Sue A. <SABurke@columbus.gov>; Hughes,
David W. <DWHughes@columbus.gov>; Miller, Robert “Mike” <RMMiller@columbus.gov>; Wentzel,
Trisha L. <TLWentzel@columbus.gov>

Subject: Light Duty Trucks

Importance: High

| have the legislation all together except for the amount being requested. Please let me know the
amount to use so we can start this piece of legislation.

Thanks!

Pam
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Purchasing Coordinator

THE CITY OF

COLUMBUS

ANDREW J. GINTHER, MAYOR

DEPARTMENT OF
PUBLIC UTILITIES

910 Dublin Rd.
Columbus, OH 43215
Direct: 614-645-6041
Fax: 614-724-0243

http://columbus.gov/
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