
Area Commission Membership Registration 

    

 A B C 

1  FIELD 

Legistar  

 

Greater Hilltop AC__ 

 

(enter the name of the 

Commission) 

 

CURRENT INFORMATION 

Legistar 

 

_Change of address/tele number 

 

(note action required - appointment, 

reappointment, resignation, 

informational change notes) 

 

NEW INFORMATION 

 

(1) Please print new 

information clearly, 

OR 

(2) Place a “check” in 

these boxes if member 

is re-elected and 

information is 

unchanged 

(3) Do not forget to 

update “Term 

Expiration” for re-

elected members 

2 First Name  

 
Lane  

3 Last Name 

 
Newcome  

4 Title Commissioner   

5 Address 

 
141 S. Sylvan Avenue  

6 City Columbus  

7 State Ohio  

8 Zip Code 43204  

9 Home Telephone 614-725-0208  

10 Work Telephone 614-272-1112  

11 Fax Number   

12 Email Address LENewcome@gmail.com  

13 District/Designation Appointed  

14 Term Start Date «Term_Start_Date» July, 2011  

15 Term Expiration «Term_Expiration» July, 2012  

 

16 
Seat Succession Karen Whitman  

 

 

 

 
 
 
 



Lane Newcome 
Appointed term expires July 2012 
 
Lane was born and raised in Columbus, Ohio in the Westgate neighborhood.  He 
attended Columbus Public Schools and graduated Valedictorian from West High School 
in 2004.  Lane went on to graduate cum laude from The Ohio State University in 2007 
with a degree in Political Science.  While at Ohio State Lane was a founding member of 
Delta Tau Delta Fraternity, where he served as the brotherhood and honorboard 
chairman as well as the recording secretary.   While at Ohio State Lane was awarded 
the Jack and Mary Reusche Scholarship, the John W. Galbreath Scholarship, Kiwanis 
Scholarship, the West High Alumni Scholarship, the Burger King Scholarship, the 
Harvard Book Award, and the Dave Koblentz Award.  Lane graduated in the top quarter 
of his class from Capital University Law School in 2010.  Lane was awarded a President 
Merit Scholarship as well as the Hilltop Aladdin Shrine’s Scholarship while at Capital.  
Lane received a certificate in Family Law and Dispute Resolution as well as the CALI 
awards for studies in divorce mediation, general practice practicum and criminal law, as 
well as a recipient of the Order of Curia.  Lane has externed with the Ohio State Senate, 
the Ohio Governor’s Office and the Franklin County Domestic Court.  Lane has worked 
with Capital University Legal Clinic as well as the Capital University Mediation Clinic.  
For the past nine years Lane has been employed with Hilltop Land Title LLC and 
Elleman and Newcome LLC.  Lane has volunteered with, the Hilltop Branch of the 
Columbus Metropolitan Library, Big Brothers and Big Sisters, and the English 
Conversation Partner’s Program at Ohio State.  Lane is a member of the Westgate 
Neighbors Association and the West High School Alumni Association.   


