Bidder Tabulation - Bid #SA005967 - BI006644
Purchase of Compact Track Loader and Trailer

Opened August 20, 2015

ITEM
# DESCRIPTION QTY|] UNIT OHIO CAT HOLDEN BOBCAT
1 | Bocat T590 or equal (per 3.3.1) | 1 | EACH $46,115.00 no bid $43,915.90
2 Trailer (per 3.3.2) 1 EACH $5,800.00 $7,853.00 $5,800.00
3 68" Low Profile Bucket (per
3.3.3.1) 1 EACH $1,410.00 no bid $731.88

4 96" Snow Pusher (per 3.3.3.2) 1 EACH $2,100.00 no bid $2,351.44
5 68" Industrial Grapple Bucket

(per 3.3.3.3) 1 | EACH $4,440.00 no bid $2,635.86
6 68" Dozer Blade (per 3.3.3.4) 1 | EACH $5,450.00 no bid $3,264.20
7 Training (per 6.9) 1 LT $0.00 no bid $0.00

$65,315.00 $58,699.28




