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FYDA Freightliner Columbus, Inc

1250 Walcott Rd

Columbus, OH 43228 Y Y Y Y Y Y Y

Other



Bid Tabulation - #SA005954 BI006639
14' Diesel Powered Step Van - Opened 8/13/2015

Company Price

FYDA Freightliner Columbus, Inc  $                    105,198.00 
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907.28 181.456 725.824

845.34 169.068 676.272



Finley Fire Equipment Co

ITEM NO Mfg. Part # Desc. Qty. Unit

1 Webb 666854B Brake Drum 40 345.73$  

2 Webb 61951B Brake Drum 40 528.26$  

3 Webb 61991B Brake Drum 40 492.45$  

4 Haldex 3030SB Brake Chamber 80 59.92$    

5 Haldex 109994K Dryer Cartridge 20 26.54$    

6 Midland 109685X Dryer Assembly 12 No Bid

7 Midland 955205X Dryer Assembly 10 No Bid

8 Midland RH55449X Caliper 15 No Bid

9 Bendix 801550 ABS Sensor 7 129.92$  

10 Bendix 801548 ABS Sensor 8 97.04$    

11 Bendix 800717 ABS Sensor 8 129.68$  

12 Bendix 5013257 Brake Pads 20 362.56$  

13 Meritor KIT2252H2DA Brake Pads 20 362.56$  

14 Meritor R802463 Slack Adjuster 6 105.84$  

15 Meritor R801074 Slack Adjuster 10 75.02$    

16 Meritor KIT15625PM Brake Pads 16 352.30$  

17 Euclid E4515QMB-N Brake Shoe Hardware Kit 60 8.01$      

18 Euclid E3518 Brake Shoe Hardware Kit 20 44.78$    

19 Euclid E9644 Brake Shoe Hardware Kit 20 16.62$    

20 Rockwell 4515EXQ Brake Shoes 120 38.16$    

21 Rockwell 4515R403X Brake Shoes 20 414.19$  

22 Rockwell 4711EX Brake Shoes 20 54.16$    

23 Leece-Neville A0014993PA Alternator 10 No Bid

24 Leece-Neville M105R2022SE Starter 10 No Bid

Price Tabulation - Bid #SA005874 - BI006602



Finley Fire Equipment CoSkinner Diesel Service Inc Last year

Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

13,829.12$ 182.93$           7,317.20$              182.05$    7,282.00$                             

21,130.24$ 278.94$           11,157.60$            278.31$    11,132.40$                           

19,697.92$ 273.58$           10,943.20$            259.31$    10,372.40$                           

4,793.60$   -$                       37.71$      3,016.80$                             

530.88$      -$                       18.92$      378.40$                                

-$                       124.74$    1,496.88$                             

-$                       134.77$    1,347.70$                             

-$                       184.16$    2,762.40$                             

909.44$      85.75$             600.25$                 84.63$      592.41$                                

776.32$      64.67$             517.36$                 63.19$      505.52$                                

1,037.44$   86.45$             691.60$                 85.31$      682.48$                                

7,251.20$   226.60$           4,532.00$              234.42$    4,688.40$                             

7,251.20$   234.77$           4,695.40$              326.11$    6,522.20$                             

635.04$      -$                       78.24$      469.44$                                

750.24$      -$                       78.24$      782.40$                                

5,636.86$   -$                       190.41$    3,046.56$                             

480.48$      -$                       6.27$        376.20$                                

895.68$      -$                       33.81$      676.20$                                

332.48$      19.20$             384.00$                 16.23$      324.60$                                

4,579.20$   25.95$             3,114.00$              24.89$      2,986.80$                             

8,283.84$   -$                       52.47$      1,049.40$                             

1,083.20$   -$                       37.00$      740.00$                                

1,195.50$        11,955.00$            1,140.41$ 11,404.10$                           

221.00$           2,210.00$              221.00$    2,210.00$                             
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