BID TABULATION

SCIOTO & DARBY CREEK ROAD 24" WATER MAIN - PART 1 - CONTRACT NO. 1021, CAPTIAL IMPROVEMENT NO. 690452
ANCHOR COMPANIES (CITY OF COLUMBUS)
Bids Received: March 6, 2006

Nicholas Savko & Sons, Inc. Tata Excavating, Inc. JFM Enterprises
Ref. o ) _ Engineer's Estimate 4636 Shuster Road 1797 Williams Road 27156 Stuart Road
No. | 'tem No. Description Unit | Quantity Columbus, Ohio 43214 Columbus, Ohio 43207 Rockbridge, Ohio 43149
Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension

1 207 Filter Fabric Fence 1,281 L.F. $2.00 $2,562.00 $2.00 $2,562.00 $2.75 $3,522.75 $1.50 $1,921.50

2 252 Permanent Pavement Replacement, Type 1 12 C.Y. $300.00 $3,600.00 $430.00 $5,160.00 $495.00 $5,940.00 $300.00 $3,600.00

3 253 Temporary Pavement 50 S.Y. $100.00 $5,000.00 $10.00 $500.00 $22.50 $1,125.00 $150.00 $7,500.00

4 614 Maintaining Traffic 1 LS. $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $3,000.00 ** $3,000.00

5 630 Removal of Ground Mounted Sign and Re-erection 2 EACH $300.00 $600.00 $100.00 $200.00 $150.00 $300.00 $520.00 ** $1,040.00
6 659 Seeding and Mulching 2,871 S.Y. $2.00 $5,742.00 $1.60 $4,593.60 $2.55 $7,321.05 $4,306.00 ** $12,362,526.00 **
7 801 24" Ductile Iron Water Pipe and Fittings, Class 54 1,465 L.F. $130.00 $190,450.00 $148.00 $216,820.00 $156.71 $229,580.15 $305,000.00 $446,825,000.00 **
8 801* Concrete Blocking Class C, Increase or Decrease 25 c.Y. $150.00 $3,750.00 $80.00 $2,000.00 $95.00 $2,375.00 $5,000.00 $125,000.00 **
9 801 20" Ductile Iron Water Pipe and Fittings, Class 54 9 L.F. $300.00 $2,700.00 $140.00 $1,260.00 $204.00 $1,836.00 $2,000.00 $18,000.00 **

10 801* Fittings, Increase or Decrease 75 LBS. $5.00 $375.00 $2.00 $150.00 $2.89 $216.75 $0.00 $0.00
11 802 24" Butterfly Valves and Appurtenances 2 EACH $4,500.00 $9,000.00 $4,100.00 $8,200.00 $3,950.00 $7,900.00 $3,000.00 ** $6,000.00 **

12 803 20" x 20" Tapping Sleeve and Valve and Appurtenances 1 EACH $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $23,500.00 $23,500.00 $20,700.00 $20,700.00 $3,200.00 ** $3,200.00

13 805 1" Water Serivce Tap, Complete 1 EACH $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $900.00 $900.00 $495.00 $495.00 $1,600.00 *¥ $1,600.00

14 805 1 1/2" Water Service Tap, Complete 1 EACH $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $750.00 $750.00 $1,800.00 *¥ $1,800.00
15 806 42" Casing Pipe 85 L.F. $550.00 $46,750.00 $580.00 $49,300.00 $465.00 $39,525.00 $76,500.00 $6,502,500.00 **
16 809 Fire Hydrant 4 EACH $2,200.00 $8,800.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00 $1,550.00 $6,200.00 $5,000.00 ** $20,000.00 **
17 810 24" Hydrant Extension 4 EACH $500.00 $2,000.00 $325.00 $1,300.00 $460.00 $1,840.00 $600.00 *4 $2,400.00 **

18 810 12" Hydrant Extension 1 EACH $400.00 $400.00 $275.00 $275.00 $330.00 $330.00 $600.00 *4 $600.00

19 810 6" Hydrant Extension 1 EACH $350.00 $350.00 $550.00 $550.00 $310.00 $310.00 $600.00 *4 $600.00
20 811* Increase and Decrease in Excavation and Backfill 200 CY. $20.00 $4,000.00 $10.00 $2,000.00 $3.50 $700.00 $4,400.00 *¥ $880,000.00 **
7A 801 24" Prestressed Concrete Water Pipe with Fittings 1,465 LF. $160.00 $234,400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $360,000.00 $527,400,000.00 **
9A 801 20" Prestressed Concrete Water Pipe with Fittings 9 LF. $350.00 $3,150.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,200.00 $19,800.00 **
Bidder's Subtotal Using Ductile Iron Pipe (Prop. Item No. 7 & No. 9): $315,079.00 $336,370.60 $340,466.70 $466,766,287.50 **
Bidder's Subtotal Using Prestressed Concrete Pipe (Prop. Item No. 7A & No. 9A): $359,479.00 No Bid No Bid $547,343,087.50 **
Special Force Account (10% of Subtotal) Using Ductile Iron Pipe (Prop. Item No. 7 & No. 9): $31,507.90 $33,637.06 $34,046.67 $46,676,628.75 **
Special Force Account (10% of Subtotal) Using Prestressed Concrete Pipe (Prop. Item No. 7A & No. 9A): $35,947.90 No Bid No Bid $54,734,308.75 **
Bidder's Total Using Ductile Iron Pipe: $346,586.90 $370,007.66 $374,513.37 $513,442,916.25 **
Bidder's Total Using Prestressed Concrete Pipe: $395,426.90 No Bid No Bid $602,077,396.25 **

AMOUNT OF BOND = N/A $370,007.66 $375,000.00 No Bond Provided

* Denotes Contingency Item

** Please see the attached sheet for an explanation of bid by JFM Enterprises

Brian M. Haemmerle, P.E.

Evans, Mechwart, Hambleton & Tilton, Inc.

5500 New Albany Road
Columbus, Ohio 43054

EMH&T JN: 2005-2497




