

Mark	Vendor acc	Type	Line number	Alternate	Rank	Total score	Total amount	Item numb
No	001397	Header		No			311,018.11	
No	001397	Line	10	No			62,235.00	
No	001397	Line	20	No			5,187.85	
No	001397	Line	30	No			22,269.90	
No	001397	Line	40	No			9,551.00	
No	001397	Line	50	No			6,791.50	
No	001397	Line	60	No			15,833.50	
No	001397	Line	70	No			0.00	
No	001397	Line	80	No			88,249.50	
No	001397	Line	90	No			13,828.32	
No	001397	Line	100	No			9,044.73	
No	001397	Line	110	No			9,044.73	
No	001397	Line	120	No			9,044.73	
No	001397	Line	130	No			11,531.25	
No	001397	Line	140	No			0.00	
No	001397	Line	150	No			6,089.00	
No	001397	Line	160	No			11,364.00	
No	001397	Line	170	No			5,600.20	
No	001397	Line	180	No			6,129.60	
No	001397	Line	190	No			3,461.90	
No	001397	Line	200	No			7,422.00	
No	001397	Line	210	No			8,339.40	
No	003880	Header		No			50,500.00	
No	003880	Line	10	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	20	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	30	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	40	No			13,900.00	
No	003880	Line	50	No			12,150.00	
No	003880	Line	60	No			24,450.00	
No	003880	Line	70	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	80	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	90	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	100	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	110	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	120	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	130	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	140	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	150	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	160	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	170	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	180	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	190	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	200	No			0.00	
No	003880	Line	210	No			0.00	
No	007513	Header		No			315,304.13	
No	007513	Line	10	No			63,075.00	

No	007513	Line	20	No			5,349.75	
No	007513	Line	30	No			22,569.60	
No	007513	Line	40	No			9,680.00	
No	007513	Line	50	No			6,883.40	
No	007513	Line	60	No			16,047.50	
No	007513	Line	70	No			0.00	
No	007513	Line	80	No			89,437.50	
No	007513	Line	90	No			14,015.43	
No	007513	Line	100	No			9,166.50	
No	007513	Line	110	No			9,166.50	
No	007513	Line	120	No			9,166.50	
No	007513	Line	130	No			11,687.25	
No	007513	Line	140	No			0.00	
No	007513	Line	150	No			6,171.00	
No	007513	Line	160	No			11,516.40	
No	007513	Line	170	No			5,676.00	
No	007513	Line	180	No			6,212.60	
No	007513	Line	190	No			3,508.50	
No	007513	Line	200	No			7,522.50	
No	007513	Line	210	No			8,452.20	

Product name	Quantity	Unit price	Line discount	Total discount	Comment	Deviation	Lead time	Procurement
			0.00	0.00		0		
Fiberglass l	75.00	829.80000			10-12 weel	0	0	Lighting po
Fiberglass f	5.00	1,037.57000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
12' Alumin	30.00	742.33000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	10.00	955.10000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	10.00	679.15000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum,	50.00	316.67000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Pole Door t	500.00	0.00000			NO BID	0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	270.00	326.85000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	27.00	512.16000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	27.00	334.99000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	27.00	334.99000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	27.00	334.99000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Split base c	25.00	461.25000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Split base c	5.00	0.00000			NO BID	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	20.00	304.45000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	120.00	94.70000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	20.00	280.01000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	20.00	306.48000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	10.00	346.19000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	30.00	247.40000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	30.00	277.98000			10-12 WEE	0	0	Lighting po
			0.00	0.00		0		
Fiberglass l	75.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Fiberglass f	5.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
12' Alumin	30.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	10.00	1,390.00000			RTAA-26.7	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	10.00	1,215.00000			RTAA-25.6	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum,	50.00	489.00000			RTAC-14-5	0	0	Lighting po
Pole Door t	500.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	270.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	27.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	27.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	27.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	27.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Split base c	25.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Split base c	5.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	20.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	120.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	20.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	20.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	10.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	30.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	30.00	0.00000				0	0	Lighting po
			0.00	0.00		0		
Fiberglass l	75.00	841.00000			FF802BK	0	0	Lighting po

Fiberglass P	5.00	1,069.95000		FF803BK	0	0	Lighting po
12' Alumin	30.00	752.32000		Hapco New	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	10.00	968.00000		Hapco 235	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	10.00	688.34000		Hapco R25	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum,	50.00	320.95000		71951P1	0	0	Lighting po
Pole Door f	500.00	0.00000		No Bid	0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	270.00	331.25000		Hapco 735	0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	27.00	519.09000		SKLW0310	0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	27.00	339.50000		70506P30	0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	27.00	339.50000		hAPCO 705	0	0	Lighting po
Transforme	27.00	339.50000		HAPCO 705	0	0	Lighting po
Split base c	25.00	467.49000		HAPCO 741	0	0	Lighting po
Split base c	5.00	0.00000		NO BID	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	20.00	308.55000		HAPCO 763	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	120.00	95.97000		HAPCO 82-	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	20.00	283.80000		HAPCO 732	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	20.00	310.63000		HAPCO 695	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	10.00	350.85000		HAPCO 685	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	30.00	250.75000		HAPCO 702	0	0	Lighting po
Aluminum	30.00	281.74000		HAPCO 702	0	0	Lighting po

USD	5,349.75	1,069.95000		
USD	22,569.60	752.32000		
USD	9,680.00	968.00000		
USD	6,883.40	688.34000		
USD	16,047.50	320.95000		
USD	0.00	0.00000		
USD	89,437.50	331.25000		
USD	14,015.43	519.09000		
USD	9,166.50	339.50000		
USD	9,166.50	339.50000		
USD	9,166.50	339.50000		
USD	11,687.25	467.49000		
USD	0.00	0.00000		
USD	6,171.00	308.55000		
USD	11,516.40	95.97000		
USD	5,676.00	283.80000		
USD	6,212.60	310.63000		
USD	3,508.50	350.85000		
USD	7,522.50	250.75000		
USD	8,452.20	281.74000		

City of Columbus Aluminum Fiberglass Light Poles									
Vendor account	Type	Line #	Alternate	Total amount	Product name	Quantity	Unit price	Comment	
RFQ002445 Opened 9/1/16									
001397/GEXPRO	Line	10	No	62,235.00	Fiberglass Decorative Lamp Post, Black	75.00	829.80000	10-12 weeks ARO MAINSTREETLIGHTING FF802BK	
003880/Kevin Lehr	Line	10	No	0.00	Fiberglass Decorative Lamp Post, Black	75.00	0.00000		
007513/Utility Supply & Construction	Line	10	No	63,075.00	Fiberglass Decorative Lamp Post, Black	75.00	841.00000	FF802BK	
001397	Line	20	No	5,187.85	Fiberglass Post Top Pole, Anchor Base, 14' M.H., Black	5.00	1,037.57000	10-12 WEEKS ARO MAINSTREETLIGHTING FF803BK	
003880	Line	20	No	0.00	Fiberglass Post Top Pole, Anchor Base, 14' M.H., Black	5.00	0.00000		
007513	Line	20	No	5,349.75	Fiberglass Post Top Pole, Anchor Base, 14' M.H., Black	5.00	1,069.95000	FF803BK	
001397	Line	30	No	22,269.90	12' Aluminum Decorative Post Top, Black	30.00	742.33000	10-12 WEEKS ARO HAPCO 31844(old 78098P.1)	
003880	Line	30	No	0.00	12' Aluminum Decorative Post Top, Black	30.00	0.00000		
007513	Line	30	No	22,569.60	12' Aluminum Decorative Post Top, Black	30.00	752.32000	Hapco New #31844	
001397	Line	40	No	9,551.00	Aluminum Light Pole	10.00	955.10000	10-12 WEEKS ARO HAPCO 23-587LT	
003880	Line	40	No	13,900.00	Aluminum Light Pole	10.00	1,390.00000	RTAA-26.7-8045-3-SBF-BMA-8-1-SBF	
007513	Line	40	No	9,680.00	Aluminum Light Pole	10.00	968.00000	Hapco 23587LT	
001397	Line	50	No	6,791.50	Aluminum Light Pole	10.00	679.15000	10-12 WEEKS ARO HAPCO R256D8B10731001	
003880	Line	50	No	12,150.00	Aluminum Light Pole	10.00	1,215.00000	RTAA-25.6-8045-3-SBF	
007513	Line	50	No	6,883.40	Aluminum Light Pole	10.00	688.34000	Hapco R256D8B10731001	
001397	Line	60	No	15,833.50	Aluminum, Direct Buried Light Pole, Post Top, Black	50.00	316.67000	10-12 WEEKS ARO HAPCO 71951P.1)	
003880	Line	60	No	24,450.00	Aluminum, Direct Buried Light Pole, Post Top, Black	50.00	489.00000	RTAC-14-5030-1-BLK	
007513	Line	60	No	16,047.50	Aluminum, Direct Buried Light Pole, Post Top, Black	50.00	320.95000	71951P1	
001397	Line	70	No	0.00	Pole Door Kit	500.00	0.00000	NO BID	
003880	Line	70	No	0.00	Pole Door Kit	500.00	0.00000		
007513	Line	70	No	0.00	Pole Door Kit	500.00	0.00000	No Bid	
001397	Line	80	No	88,249.50	Transformer base, medium base	270.00	326.85000	10-12 WEEKS AROHAPCO 73556(satin alum finish)	

City of Columbus Aluminum Fiberglass Light Poles								
Vendor account	Type	Line #	Alternate	Total amount	Product name	Quantity	Unit price	Comment
003880	Line	80	No	0.00	Transformer base, medium base	270.00	0.00000	
007513	Line	80	No	89,437.50	Transformer base, medium base	270.00	331.25000	Hapco 73556
001397	Line	90	No	13,828.32	Transformer base, large base-modified	27.00	512.16000	10-12 WEEKS ARO HAPCO SKLW031009A/29031
003880	Line	90	No	0.00	Transformer base, large base-modified	27.00	0.00000	
007513	Line	90	No	14,015.43	Transformer base, large base-modified	27.00	519.09000	SKLW031009A/29031
001397	Line	100	No	9,044.73	Transformer base, aluminum, medium bronze	27.00	334.99000	10-12 WEEKS ARO HAPCO 70506P.30
003880	Line	100	No	0.00	Transformer base, aluminum, medium bronze	27.00	0.00000	
007513	Line	100	No	9,166.50	Transformer base, aluminum, medium bronze	27.00	339.50000	70506P30
001397	Line	110	No	9,044.73	Transformer base, aluminum, medium green	27.00	334.99000	10-12 WEEKS ARO HAPCO 70506P.42
003880	Line	110	No	0.00	Transformer base, aluminum, medium green	27.00	0.00000	
007513	Line	110	No	9,166.50	Transformer base, aluminum, medium green	27.00	339.50000	hAPCO 70506P42
001397	Line	120	No	9,044.73	Transformer base, aluminum, medium white,	27.00	334.99000	10-12 WEEKS ARO HAPCO 7050P.21
003880	Line	120	No	0.00	Transformer base, aluminum, medium white,	27.00	0.00000	
007513	Line	120	No	9,166.50	Transformer base, aluminum, medium white,	27.00	339.50000	HAPCO 70506P21
001397	Line	130	No	11,531.25	Split base cover	25.00	461.25000	10-12 WEEKS ARO HAPCO 74158-001P1
003880	Line	130	No	0.00	Split base cover	25.00	0.00000	
007513	Line	130	No	11,687.25	Split base cover	25.00	467.49000	HAPCO 74158001P1
001397	Line	140	No	0.00	Split base cover	5.00	0.00000	NO BID
003880	Line	140	No	0.00	Split base cover	5.00	0.00000	
007513	Line	140	No	0.00	Split base cover	5.00	0.00000	NO BID
001397	Line	150	No	6,089.00	Aluminum bracket	20.00	304.45000	10-12 WEEKS ARO HAPCO 76306P.42
003880	Line	150	No	0.00	Aluminum bracket	20.00	0.00000	
007513	Line	150	No	6,171.00	Aluminum bracket	20.00	308.55000	HAPCO 76306P42
001397	Line	160	No	11,364.00	Aluminum bracket	120.00	94.70000	10-12 WEEKS ARO HAPCO 82-003
003880	Line	160	No	0.00	Aluminum bracket	120.00	0.00000	
007513	Line	160	No	11,516.40	Aluminum bracket	120.00	95.97000	HAPCO 82-003

City of Columbus Aluminum Fiberglass Light Poles								
Vendor account	Type	Line #	Alternate	Total amount	Product name	Quantity	Unit price	Comment
001397	Line	170	No	5,600.20	Aluminum bracket	20.00	280.01000	10-12 WEEKS ARO HAPCO 73280
003880	Line	170	No	0.00	Aluminum bracket	20.00	0.00000	
007513	Line	170	No	5,676.00	Aluminum bracket	20.00	283.80000	HAPCO 73280
001397	Line	180	No	6,129.60	Aluminum bracket	20.00	306.48000	10-12 WEEKS ARO HAPCO 69919
003880	Line	180	No	0.00	Aluminum bracket	20.00	0.00000	
007513	Line	180	No	6,212.60	Aluminum bracket	20.00	310.63000	HAPCO 69919
001397	Line	190	No	3,461.90	Aluminum bracket "shepherd crook"	10.00	346.19000	10-12 WEEKS AROHAPCO 68536
003880	Line	190	No	0.00	Aluminum bracket "shepherd crook"	10.00	0.00000	
007513	Line	190	No	3,508.50	Aluminum bracket "shepherd crook"	10.00	350.85000	HAPCO 68536
001397	Line	200	No	7,422.00	Aluminum bracket	30.00	247.40000	10-12 WEEKS AROHAPCO 70250-002P.30
003880	Line	200	No	0.00	Aluminum bracket	30.00	0.00000	
007513	Line	200	No	7,522.50	Aluminum bracket	30.00	250.75000	HAPCO 70250002P30
001397	Line	210	No	8,339.40	Aluminum bracket	30.00	277.98000	10-12 WEEKS ARO HAPCO 70249-001
003880	Line	210	No	0.00	Aluminum bracket	30.00	0.00000	
007513	Line	210	No	8,452.20	Aluminum bracket	30.00	281.74000	HAPCO 70249001
001397	Header		No	311,018.11				
003880	Header		No	50,500.00				
007513	Header		No	315,304.13				