
BID TABULATION 

SA001589, 65’ Bucket Truck 

 

 

 

 Lift-All 

Fort Wayne, 

IN 

Byers 

Columbus, 

OH 

Center City 

Columbus, 

OH 

Dueco 

Waukesha, 

WI 

Cab & Chassis $54,365.00 $60,543.00 $51,686.25 $46,404.00 

Aerial Tower 53,247.00 No Bid No Bid 73,587.00 

Utility Body 36,387.00 No Bid No Bid 16,943.00 

Complete Unit 143,999.00 142,206.00 No Bid 136,934.00 

Rhino Lining 1,825.00 667.00 No Bid 2,250.00 

Extended  

Warranty - Unit 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

1,350.00 

Laptop 

Computer 

 

2,965.00 

 

No Bid 

 

8,040.00 

 

7,935.00 

Extended 

Warranty- 

Laptop 

 

120.00 

 

No Bid 

Standard 

3 Year 

 

179.00 

Total $148,909.00 $142,873.00 Incomplete $148,648.00 

 

 

 


