

		Asplundh Tree Service	Russell Tree Service	Wright Tree Service	
IQA-TTV-	NTT-1	Trimming crew, truck accessible street access locations, up to 15 kV	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 7,250.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	NTT-2	Trimming crew, truck accessible street access locations - up to 600 V	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 6,750.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	NTT-3	Trimming crew, non-truck accessible locations (climbing) - up to 15 kV	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 7,575.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	NTT-4	Trimming crew, non-truck accessible locations (climbing) - up to 600 V	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 7,250.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	NTT-5	Trimming crew, limited access locations (not maintained roadway) - up to 15 kV	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	NTT-6	Trimming crew, limited access locations (not maintained roadway) - up to 600 V	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 9,250.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	NTR-1	0" to 5"	\$ 44.66	\$ 175.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	NTR-2	6" to 8"	\$ 65.10	\$ 225.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	NTR-3	9" to 18"	\$ 260.40	\$ 600.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	NTR-4	19" to 24"	\$ 781.20	\$ 2,000.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	NTR-5	25"+	Labor & Eq Hourly	\$ 3,000.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	NTR-6	Tree Stump Grinding	Labor & Eq Hourly	\$ 150.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	NCA-1	Low Volume Backpack Foliar (per acre)	\$ 81.30	\$ 1,250.00	740
IQA-TTV-	NCA-2	Basal Treatment (per acre)	\$ 193.35	\$ 2,500.00	931
IQA-TTV-	NCA-3	Soil Injection (per tree)	\$ 3.00	\$ 120.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	NEQ-1	4WD Pick-up	\$ 14.21	\$ 25.00	\$ 13.79
IQA-TTV-	NEQ-2	Aerial Lift	\$ 21.85	\$ 65.00	\$ 19.96
IQA-TTV-	NEQ-3	All Terrain Tree Trimmer	\$ 61.59	\$ 175.00	\$ 41.20
IQA-TTV-	NEQ-4	Back Yard Lift	\$ 46.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 28.37
IQA-TTV-	NEQ-5	Bush Hog	\$ 21.38	\$ 145.00	\$ 44.00
IQA-TTV-	NEQ-6	Chipper	\$ 5.74	\$ 25.00	\$ 5.15
IQA-TTV-	NEQ-7	Chipper Left Behind	\$ 0	\$ 18.75	NO BID

		Asplundh Tree Service	Russell Tree Service	Wright Tree Service
IQA-TTV-NEQ-8	Full-size Pick-up	\$ 12.18	\$ 25.00	\$ 13.79
IQA-TTV-NEQ-9	Heavy Brush Cutter	\$ 56.63	\$ 225.00	\$ 64.26
IQA-TTV-NEQ-10	Lift Truck	\$ 23.48	\$ 35.00	\$ 19.96
IQA-TTV-NEQ-11	Off-Road Aerial Lift	\$ 36.56	\$ 85.00	\$ 39.58
IQA-TTV-NEQ-12	Pickup Truck	\$ 10.16	\$ 20.00	\$ 12.24
IQA-TTV-NEQ-13	Pole Power Saw	\$ 1.00	\$ 4.50	Included
IQA-TTV-NEQ-14	Power Saw	\$ 1.00	\$ 3.50	Included
IQA-TTV-NEQ-15	Prentice Loader	\$ -	\$ 250.00	\$ 28.49
IQA-TTV-NEQ-16	Split Dump	\$ 9.89	\$ 35.00	\$ 10.42
IQA-TTV-NEQ-17	Stump Grinder	\$ 19.94	\$ 175.00	\$ 24.07
IQA-TTV-NEQ-18	Tractor	\$ -	\$ 55.00	\$ 46.35
IQA-TTV-NEQ-19	Trailer	\$ -	\$ 20.00	\$ 4.12
IQA-TTV-NEQ-20	Truck Left Behind	\$ -	\$ 15.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-NEQ-21	Weed Eater	\$ 1.00	\$ 2.00	Included
IQA-TTV-NHL-1	Tree Trimmer	\$ 37.50	\$ 55.00	\$ 54.76
IQA-TTV-NHL-10T	Tree Trimmer-OT	\$ 52.35	\$ 82.00	\$ 67.45
IQA-TTV-NHL-1DT	Tree Trimmer-DT	\$ 67.32	\$ 110.00	\$ 80.15
IQA-TTV-NHL-2	Grounds man	\$ 31.93	\$ 45.00	\$ 47.63
IQA-TTV-NHL-20T	Grounds man - OT	\$ 44.70	\$ 67.50	\$ 57.85
IQA-TTV-NHL-2DT	Grounds man - DT	\$ 57.47	\$ 90.00	\$ 68.07
IQA-TTV-NHL-3	Supervisor	\$ 49.71	\$ 110.00	\$ 62.33
IQA-TTV-NHL-30T	Supervisor - OT	\$ 69.60	\$ 165.00	\$ 77.66

		Asplundh Tree Service	Russell Tree Service	Wright Tree Service	
IQA-TTV-	NHL-3DT	Supervisor - DT	\$ 89.49	\$ 120.00	\$ 92.99
IQA-TTV-	NHL-4	General Foreman	\$ 49.71	\$ 90.00	\$ 52.13
IQA-TTV-	NHL-4OT	General Foreman - OT	\$ 69.00	\$ 135.00	\$ 68.94
IQA-TTV-	NHL-4DT	General Foreman - DT	\$ 89.49	\$ 180.00	\$ 85.75
IQA-TTV-	NHL-5	Climber	\$ 37.40	\$ 70.00	\$ 58.25
IQA-TTV-	NHL-5OT	Climber - OT	\$ 52.35	\$ 105.00	\$ 72.16
IQA-TTV-	NHL-5DT	Climber - DT	\$ 67.32	\$ 140.00	\$ 86.07
IQA-TTV-	NHL-6	Mowing Grounds Person	\$ 31.93	\$ 40.00	\$ 47.63
IQA-TTV-	NHL-6OT	Mowing Grounds Person - OT	\$ 44.70	\$ 60.00	\$ 57.85
IQA-TTV-	NHL-6DT	Mowing Grounds Person - DT	\$ 57.47	\$ 80.00	\$ 68.07
IQA-TTV-	NHL-7	Spray Technician	\$ 37.40	\$ 95.00	\$ 54.76
IQA-TTV-	NHL-7OT	Spray Technician - OT	\$ 52.35	\$ 142.50	\$ 67.45
IQA-TTV-	NHL-7DT	Spray Technician - DT	\$ 67.32	\$ 190.00	\$ 80.15
IQA-TTV-	NHL-8	Other	n/a	n/a	
IQA-TTV-	NHL-9	Other _____	n/a	n/a	
IQA-TTV-	NHL-10	Certified Arborist	\$ 49.71	\$ 110.00	\$ 60.38
IQA-TTV-	NHL-10OT	Certified Arborist -OT	\$ 69.60	\$ 165.00	\$ 79.99
IQA-TTV-	NHL-10DT	Certified Arborist -DT	\$ 89.49	\$ 220.00	\$ 99.60
IQA-TTV-	EIT-1	Trimming crew, truck accessible street access locations, up to 15 kV	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	EIT-2	Trimming crew, truck accessible street access locations - up to 600 V	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 7,500.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	EIT-3	Trimming crew, non-truck accessible locations (climbing) - up to 15 kV	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 8,275.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	EIT-4	Trimming crew, non-truck accessible locations (climbing) - up to 600 V	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 7,750.00	NO BID

		Asplundh Tree Service	Russell Tree Service	Wright Tree Service	
IQA-TTV-	ETT-5	Trimming crew, limited access locations (not maintained roadway) - up to 15 kV	\$ 80,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	ETT-6	Trimming crew, limited access locations (not maintained roadway) - up to 600 V	\$ 80,000.00	\$ 9,750.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	ETR-1	0" to 5"	\$ 44.66	\$ 275.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	ETR-2	6" to 8"	\$ 65.10	\$ 365.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	ETR-3	9" to 18"	\$ 260.40	\$ 900.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	ETR-4	19" to 24"	\$ 781.20	\$ 3,000.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	ETR-5	25"+	Labor & Eq Hourly	\$ 4,500.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	ETR-6	Tree Stump Grinding	Labor & Eq Hourly	\$ 225.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	ECA-1	Low Volume Backpack Foliar (per acre)	\$ 581.30	\$ 1,875.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	ECA-2	Basal Treatment (per acre)	\$ 5,193.35	\$ 3,750.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	ECA-3	Soil Injection (per tree)	\$ 3.00	\$ 180.00	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-1	4WD Pick-up	\$ 14.21	\$ 25.00	\$ 14.96
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-2	Aerial Lift	\$ 21.85	\$ 65.00	\$ 27.43
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-3	All Terrain Tree Trimmer	\$ 61.59	\$ 175.00	\$ 41.20
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-4	Back Yard Lift	\$ 48.85	\$ 75.00	\$ 28.37
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-5	Bush Hog	\$ 21.38	\$ 145.00	\$ 44.01
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-6	Chipper	\$ 5.74	\$ 25.00	\$ 7.12
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-7	Chipper Left Behind	\$ -	\$ 18.75	NO BID
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-8	Full-size Pick-up	\$ 12.18	\$ 25.00	\$ 14.96
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-9	Heavy Brush Cutter	\$ 56.63	\$ 225.00	\$ 64.26
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-10	Lift Truck	\$ 21.85	\$ 35.00	\$ 27.43
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-11	Off-Road Aerial Lift	\$ 36.56	\$ 85.00	\$ 19.58

		Asplundh Tree Service	Russell Tree Service	Wright Tree Service
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-12	Pickup Truck	\$ 10.16 \$ 25.00	\$ 12.24
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-13	Pole Power Saw	\$ 1.00 \$ 45.00	Included
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-14	Power Saw	\$ 1.00 \$ 3.50	Included
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-15	Prentice Loader		\$ 28.49
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-16	Split Dump	\$ 9.89 \$ 35.00	\$ 16.11
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-17	Stump Grinder	\$ 19.94 \$ 175.00	\$ 24.07
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-18	Tractor		\$ 46.35
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-19	Trailer		\$ 4.12
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-20	Truck Left Behind		\$ NO BID
IQA-TTV-	EEQ-21	Weed Eater	\$ 1.00 \$ 2.00	Included
IQA-TTV-	EHL-1	Tree Trimmer	\$ 37.40 \$ 110.00	\$ 84.06
IQA-TTV-	EHL-10T	Tree Trimmer-OT	\$ 52.35 \$ 110.00	\$ 84.06
IQA-TTV-	EHL-1DT	Tree Trimmer-DT	\$ 67.32 \$ 110.00	\$ 103.54
IQA-TTV-	EHL-2	Grounds man	\$ 31.93 \$ 90.00	\$ 51.73
IQA-TTV-	EHL-20T	Grounds man-OT	\$ 44.70 \$ 90.00	\$ 51.73
IQA-TTV-	EHL-2DT	Grounds man-DT	\$ 57.47 \$ 90.00	\$ 62.29
IQA-TTV-	EHL-3	On-Site Storm Coordinator	\$ 49.71 \$ 220.00	\$ 111.40
IQA-TTV-	EHL-30T	On-Site Storm Coordinator-OT	\$ 69.60 \$ 220.00	\$ 111.40
IQA-TTV-	EHL-3DT	On-Site Storm Coordinator-DT	\$ 89.49 \$ 220.00	\$ 136.62
IQA-TTV-	EHL-4	General Foreman	\$ 49.71 \$ 180.00	\$ 106.50
IQA-TTV-	EHL-40T	General Foreman-OT	\$ 69.60 \$ 180.00	\$ 106.50
IQA-TTV-	EHL-4DT	General Foreman-DT	\$ 89.49 \$ 180.00	\$ 130.45

		Asplundh Tree Service	Russell Tree Service	Wright Tree Service
IQA-TTV-	EHL-5	Climber	\$ 37.40	\$ 84.06
IQA-TTV-	EHL-5OT	Climber-OT	\$ 52.35	\$ 84.06
IQA-TTV-	EHL-5DT	Climber-DT	\$ 67.32	\$ 103.54
IQA-TTV-	EHL-6	Safety Personnel	\$ 49.71	\$ 106.50
IQA-TTV-	EHL-6OT	Safety Personnel-OT	\$ 69.60	\$ 106.50
IQA-TTV-	EHL-6DT	Safety Personnel-DT	\$ 89.49	\$ 130.45
IQA-TTV-	EHL-7	Other - Crew Foreman	\$ 43.36	\$ 91.22
IQA-TTV-	EHL-7OT	Other - Crew Foreman - OT	\$ 60.70	\$ 91.22
IQA-TTV-	EHL-7DT	Other - Crew Foreman - DT	\$ 78.05	\$ 112.66
IQA-TTV-	EHL-8	Other		n/a