City Of Columbus Public Service Department

Mavor Michael B, Coleman
Mark Kelsey, Director

MEMORANDUM

TO: Mark Kelsey
Director
FROM: Randall J. Bowman, P.E.

Interim Transportation Division Administrator/City Engineer
SUBJECT:  Souder Avenue improvements
ORD #: 1123-2007
DATE: July 2, 2007

This memorandum is a recommendation for construction contractor selection and processing
the construction legislation for the Souder Avenue Improvements (Campbell Avenue to Thomas
Avenue) Project.

Summarized History: This UIRF project upgrades the gap of roadway improvements already
made to the north and south along Souder Avenue.

Scope: The project scope includes full depth roadway replacement and the addition of curb and
gutter, sidewalks, curb ramps, and storm drainage.

Project Status: This project was bid on June 21, 2007.

Reason for Request: This project is necessary to repair the deteriorating street and to upgrade
the roadway with curbs, sidewalks, and storm drainage.

Fiscal Impact: The project cost will be paid for with funds from the 2006 Capital Improvement
Budget.

Schedule: The contract length is 60 days. The Notice to Proceed is expected in September
2007.

Construction Cost: The Engineer’s Estimate was $357,257.56.

Bidding Information:

Bidders Bid Amount
Columbus Asphalt Paving, Inc. $289,084 .99
Nicholas Savko & Sons, Inc. $301,820.95
Decker Construction Company $304,865.28
The Shelly Company $353,625.00
Shelly and Sands, Inc. $364 . 448.00
Trucco Construction Company, inc. $382,607.32
614-645-8290 Director's Office City Hall, 90 West Broad Street, 3™ Floor, Columbus, Ohlo 43215-9009 FAX: 614-645-7805
614-645-3111 311 Service Center 2100 Alum Creek Drive, Columbus, Ohio 43207-1705 FAX: 614-645-3053
614-645-6400 Parking Violations Bursay 400 W, Whittier Street, Columbus, Ohio 43215-5036 FAX: 614-645-7357
614-645-7620 Refuse Collection Division 21060 Alum Creek Drive, Columbus, Ohio 43207-1714 FAX: 614-845-7296
514-645-8376 Transporiation Division 109 North Front Street, 3™ Floor, Columbus, Ohio 432159023 FAX: 614-645-6938

The City of Columbus is an Egual Opportunity Emplover



Mark Kelsey
July 2, 2007
Page Z of 2

To aid in your review of this recommendation find attached the following:
1. Proposal Checkiist,
2. State Auditor forms regarding tax liens for company and individual who signed on behalf
of the company,
A map of the limits of the project,
EBO Statistics Form,
A bid tabulation,
Quality Contractor Evaluation.

Sk w

A bid tabulation was completed for six bidders.

Request Detail:
With reference to bids received on June 21, 2007, | wish to make the following recommendation
for the subject improvement:

Award be made to the most responsive and respensible bidder, Nicholas Savko & Sons, Inc.,
4636 Shuster Road, Columbus, Ohio 43214 for their bid of $301,820.95, which is $55,436.61
under the Engineer’s estimate of $357,257.56. Note that the low bid proposed by Columbus
Asphalt Paving, Inc. was rejected because it was incomplete (unsigned).

Emergency Action: Emergency action is necessary in order to start and complete construction
this season. If you have any questions, please call Drew Bobay at 645-6068.

RJB/DR/TJM/AVB/ab
Attachment(s)

cc: David Mackey, P.E., Interim Assistant Administrator

Diane Mosher, Department Fiscal Officer
file
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TRANSPORTATION DIVISION
PROPOSAL CHECKLIST

Project Name: JouUdDep AVENUE IMPROVEMENTS

Contractor: N jcHetAs SAVKS “‘?'éf <oMS

Proposal Guaranty (attached bond or certified check)

Proposal Affidavit completed and notarized (if contractor other
than sole proprietor) P-36

Check for any tax liens on the construction company and affiant
from the following website:
hitp://www.auditor.state.oh.us/StateAgencies/FFR/Certified/
Print and initial to submit with contract recommendation memo
and make a copy for the file folder.

CK TASK PAGE
v~ | Type of Proposal Guaranty and amount (expressed in dollars) P-26
v~ | Name and address of bidder P-26
/| Unit Price and Lump Sum bid sheets completed

Contract Compliance No.on bid sheets, or completed
| application for certification attached
v/ | Bid totaled

AA | Receipt of Addenda acknowledged P-27
v/ | Proposal signed and dated by authorized person P-27
¥’ | Qualifications and Resources of bidder completed P-28
v/ | Proposed subcontractor information completed P-28, 29
5/ Non-Collusion Affidavit completed and notarized P-30
/

/

IF PROPOSAL BOND

CK TASK PAGE
¥ | Bond form completed (must show dollar amt., not %) P-32
/| Signature of Bidder and Surety affidavit P-32
/. | Authority of Agent to bind Surety attached P-33
/| Financial Statement of Surety attached (Section 3929.01) P-34

Current State of Ohio Dept. of Insurance Certificate of
J Compliance. If expired call 644-3242 or 644-2658, or check
online at www.ohioinsurance.gov P-35

IF CERTIFIED CHECK

CK TASK PAGE

Certified Check payable to “Treasurer -City of Columbus, Ohio”
NA | attached

CHECKED BY: _ IDReL, BoRAY

Ji\ProjectMgi\Checklists\026 Proposal Checklist.doc




TRANSPORTATION DIVISION
PROPOSAL CHECKLIST

Project Name: <ouDNER  AvEN UE  IpMPROVEMENTS

Contractor: _(oywmBus  AspHAar  FPAviN s
CK TASK PAGE
v | Type of Proposal Guaranty and amount (expressed in dollars) P-26
v | Name and address of bidder P-26
/| Unit Price and Lump Sum bid sheets completed
Contract Compliance No.on bid sheets, or completed
1/ application for certification attached fFupips < ﬁ”/ 2.3 / e E
/| Bid totaled Y
nA | Receipt of Addenda acknowledged P-27
e%f/,,/w Proposal signed and dated by authorized perscon P-27
v | Qualifications and Resources of bidder completed P-28
Proposed subcontractor information completed P-28, 29
v’ Non-Collusion Affidavit completed and notarized P-30
/| Proposal Guaranty (attached bond or certified check) p-32
V/ Proposal Affidavit completed and notarized (if contractor other
than sole proprietor) P-36
Check for any tax liens on the construction company and affiant
/ from the following website:
v | hitp//www.auditor.state.oh.us/StateAgencies/FFR/Certified/
Print and initial to submit with contract recommendation memo
and make a copy for the file folder.
IF PROPOSAL BOND
CK TASK PAGE
v/ | Bond form completed (must show dollar amt., not %) P-32
v | Signature of Bidder and Surety affidavit P-32
v/ | Authority of Agent to bind Surety attached P-33
V| Financial Statement of Surety attached (Section 3929.01) P-34
Current State of Ohio Dept. of Insurance Certificate of
J Compliance. If expired call 644-3242 or 644-2658, or check
online at www.ohioinsurance.gov P-35
IF CERTIFIED CHECK
CK TASK PAGE

Certified Check payable to “Treasurer -City of Columbus, Ohio”
NA | attached

CHECKED BY: [ N\@e i BoR4N

JAProjectMgiiChecklists\026 Proposal Checklist.doc
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. AUDITOR OF STATE

tast 1 VUL &

Office of Auditor of State
88 East Broad Street
Post Office Box 1140

! State oF OQHIO

Columbus, OH 43216-1140
(614) 466-4514
(800) 282-0370

Auditor of State - Unresolved Findings for Recovery Certified Search

I have searched The Auditor of State’s unresolved findings for recovery database using the

following criteria:

Contractor's Information:

Name: Savko, Stephen
Organization: Nicholas Savko & Sons, Inc. \

Date: 06/27/2007

Al
Lo

This search produced the following list of possible matches:
15 Possible matches were found

Mame/Organization

Address

Herbert, Stephen

1580 Home Road Delaware, OH 43015

Sites, Stephen

845 Marion Pike Coal Grove, OH 45638

Bocook, Steve

Brown, Steve

8391 Stratton Circle Anchorage, AK 99507

Brown, Steven

3906 Linda Road Hilliard, OH 43026

Crockett, Steve

3280 Morse Rd., Suite 214 Columbus, OH 43231

Garris, Steven

596 East Bell Avenue McConnelsvilie, OH 43756

Haddix, Stella

McNichols-Flynn, Amy

398 Hill Street Coshocton, OH 43812

Musick-Hill, Stephanie

15261 5t. RL, 243 Chesapeake, OH 45619

Neff, Steve

638 Twp. Rd. 150 Sullivan, OH 44880

Nichol, Mark

7360 5.R, 45 Lisbon, OH 44432

Setzer, Steve

13 Honeysuckle Lane Jackson, OH 45640

Thomas, Steve

5978 Rossetter Rd. Albany, OH 45710

Williams, Steve

61 Potomac Road Murraysville, OH 46164

The above list represents possible matches for the search criteria you entered. Please note that
pursuant to ORC 9.24, only the person (which includes an organization) actually named in the

finding for recovery is prohibited from being awarded a contract.

If the person you are searching for appears on this list, it means that the person has one or more
findings for recovery and is prohibited from being awarded a contract described in ORC 8.24,
uniess one of the exceptions in that section apply.

If the person you are searching for does not appear on this list, an initialed copy of this page can
serve as documentation of your compliance with ORC 9.24(E).

Please note that pursuant to ORC 9.24, it is the responsibility of the public office to verify that a

http://www.auditor.state.oh.us/State Agencies/FFR/Certified/Default.aspx 6/27/2007
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person to whom it plans to award a contract does not appear in the Auditor of State’s database.
The Auditor of State’s office is not responsible for inaccurate search results caused by user error
or other circumstances beyond the Auditor of State’s control.

http://www .auditor.state.oh.us/State Agencies/FFR/Certified/Default.aspx 6/27/2007
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CITY OF COLUMBUS
PUBLIC SERVICE DEPARTMENT

TRANSPORTATION DIVISION
SOUDER AVENUE IMPROVEMENTS EBO Statistics

Date: June 22, 2007

Information regarding the status of a company may be accessed on the City of Columbus Internet,
Equal Business Opportunity, Certified Businesses. You will find two lists, Certified, and Registered.
Please indicate the company’s EBO status and which list they were on.

[ 1 No bids with a <10% differential

Low Bid: $ 289,084.99

B Bid(s) with a less than 10% differential (see specific bids)

CONTRACTOR Yo MBE | FBE | CERTFD | REGSTR
Columbus Asphait Paving, Inc. 89.6 | [ | [] ] []
SUB-CONTRACTOR % MBE | FBE | CERTFD | REGSTR
Paul Peterson Company 100 | [ ] | [] [ L]
Griffin Pavement Striping, Inc. 0.4 [ [] L]
][ N L]
L] [] [] L]
OO C N
[ | [

Second Bid: $301,820.95

B Loss than 10% diffe

rence from low bid

CONTRACTOR % MBE | FBE | CERTFD | REGSTR
Nickolas Savko & Sons, Ins. 89 L1 [ L] L]
SUB-CONTRACTOR % MBE | FBE | CERTFD | REGSTR
Chemcote, Incorporated 6 REEER ] L]
Griffin Pavement Striping, Inc. 1 L O ] L]
Paul Peterson Company 4 [ ] || [ ] [ ]
HEEE [ ] []
OO O T
EEEN L] [ |

Third Bid: $304,865.28

B i ess than 10% diffe

rence from low bid

CONTRACTOR % MBE | FBE | CERTFD | REGSTR
Decker Construction Company 90 HEER [] L]
SUB-CONTRACTOR Yo MBE | FBE | CERTFD | REGSTR
Griffin Pavement Striping, Inc 1 [ [ | [ [
W.L. Markers, Inc. 1 | L | [ ]
MP Dory, Co. 4 1 [ ] [
Paul Peterson Company 4 REEN | [
BN | L]
HEEE ] [




Fourth Bid: $353,625.00

i:% Less than 10% difference from low bid

CONTRACTOR % MBE | FBE | CERTFD | REGSTR

The Shelly Company 736 | [ | L] L] [
SUB-CONTRACTOR % MBE | FBE | CERTFD | REGSTR

Coady Construction Company 1.1 BEEN ] ]

Griffin Pavement Striping, Inc 0.2 [ ] ] [ ] [ |

W.L. Markers, Inc. 0.2 L] ] B |

Matmar, Inc. 1.9 [ [ ] B |

Complete Clearing, Inc. 0.7 [ B ] | ]

Decker Construction Company 223 | [ ] | [ - [ ]

Fifth Bid: $364,448.00 [ ] Less than 10% difference from low bid

CONTRACTOR % MBE  FBE | CERTFD | REGSTR

Shelly & Sands, Inc. 95 HEER L] L]
SUB-CONTRACTOR % MBE | FBE CERTFD | REGSTR

MP Dory, Co. 3 RN L L]

John K. Leohner, Co. 1 [ ] ] L L]

BOCA Construction, Inc. 1 HEER L] [l

HEER [] L

[ ][] [ ] L]

HEEN L] L]

Sixth Bid: $382,607.32 [ | Less than 10% difference from low bid

CONTRACTOR % MBE FBE | CERTFD | REGSTR

Trucco Construction 935 [ |  [] L] [
SUB-CONTRACTOR % MBE FBE | CERTFD | REGSTR

Paul Peterson Company 5.2 BEEER [ ||

Griffin Pavernent Striping, Inc. 1.3 | [ | [ _ |

1] [ L] [

L L L] L]

ERRENENE

HEEN Ll L]

J\Project Mgt \Coniract Templates\150 Subcontractor EBQO Statistics.doc




Souder Avente improvements

BID TABULATION
BID OPENING DATE:6/21/2007

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

Columbus Asphalt Paving Inc
1196 Technology Drive
Gahanna, OH 43230

Nickolas Savko & Sons
4636 Shuster Road
Columbus, OH 43214

Decker Construction Co
3040 McKintey Avenue
Columbus, OH 43204

The Shelly Company
1771 Harmon Avenue
Columbus, OH 43223

Shelly and Sands, Inc
1615 Harmon Avenue
Columbus, OH 43216

Trucco Construction
3046 Home Road
Powell, O 43065

NO. | ITEM DESCRIPTION m UNITS m9c>zﬁ:‘< UNIT PRICE m TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE m TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE h TOTAL PRICE| UNIT PRICE _ TOTAL PRICE| UNIT PRICE m TOTAL PRICE! UNIT PRICE m TOTAL PRICE| UNIT PRICE _ TOTAL PRICE
Souder Avenue Improvements
1] 201 ICLEARING AND GRUBBING LUMP 1 $3.000.00] § 3,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,040.54 $1,040.54 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
2] 202 SIDEWALK REMOVED SF 1,487 §2.001 % 2,.974.00 $1.50 $2,230.50 $1.00 $1,487.00 $2.54 $3,776.98 $3.50 $5,204 50 $3.00 $4,461.00 $2.00 $2,974.00
3] 202 |CURB REMOVED LF 327 $8.00 § 2,616.00 $10.00 $3,270.00 $6.00 $1,962.00 $9.83 $3,214.44 $8.00 $2,616.00 $8.00 $2.616.00 $2.00 $981.00
41 202 |INLET REMOVED EA 1 $500.00] $ 500.00 $360.00 $350.00 $350.00 $350.00 $444.93 $444 93 $400.00 $400.00 $100.00 $100.00 $500.00 $500.00
5| 202 |PIPE REMOVED LF 24 $45.00| § 1,080.00 $26.00 $624 00 $11.60 $278.40 $28.81 $691.44 $32.00 $768.00 $15.00 $360.00 $30.00 $720.00
6] 202 IFENCE REMOVED LF 337 $5.501 5 1,653 50 $3.50 $1,179.50 $7.00 $2,359.00 $65.28 $1,769.25 $10.00 $3,370.00 $5.00 $1,685.00 $10.00 $3,370.00
7] 203 IEXCAVATION CcY 518 $30.00] & 1554000 $25.00 $12,950.00 §31.00 $16,058.00 $32.94 $17,062.92 $44.00 $22,792.00 $30.00 $15,540,00 $32.00 $16,576.00
8] 2032 EMBANKMENT CY 7 $30.001 § 210.00 $20.00 $140.00 $2.20 $15.40 $49.38 $345 .66 $85.00 $595.00 $35.00 $245.00 $4.00 $28.00
9] 204 [EXCAVATION OF SUBGRADE* 500 $30.00] $ 15,000.00 $22.00 $11,000.00 $7.00 $3,500.00 $17.01 $8,505.00 $12.00 $6,000.00 $12.00 $6,000.00 $23.00 $11.500.00
101 204 GRANULAR EMBANKMENT* 500 $30.00] $ 15,000.00 $26.00 $13,000.00 %25.00 $12,500.00 §25.00 $12,500.00 $28.00 $14,000.00 $30.00 $15,000.00 $33.00 $16.500.00
11] 204 |GEOTEXTILE FABRIC” 750 $6.00| § 4,500.00 $1.30 $975.00 §1.20 $900.00 $1.25 $937.50 $1.35 $1,012.50 $1.50 $1,125.00 $1.50 $1,125.00
12 204 [PROOF ROLLING® 1 5118.001 & 118.00 $70.00 $70.00 $125.00 $125.00 $111.88 $111.88 $110.00 $110.00 $125.00 $125.00 $140.00 $140.00
13] 207 124" FILTER FABRIC FENCE 642 $2.00 % 1,284 .00 $1.50 $963.00 $2.10 $1,348.20 $1.42 $911.64 $2.50 $1,605.00 $1.25 $802.50 $1.50 $963.00
141 207 HNLET PROTECTION - BEAVER DAMS 5 $150.00] § 750.00 $90.00 $450.00 $100.00 $500.00 $80.00 $400.00 $125.00 $625.00 $90.00 $450.00 $80.00 $400.00
151 252 IPAVEMENT REPLACEMENT, TYFE 1 - BITUMINOUS 4 250001 % 1,600.00 $260.00 $1,000.00 $365.00 §1,580.00 350.00 1,400.00 $550.00 $2.200.00 $500.00 $2,000.00 $500.00 $2.000.00
16 252 [TEMPORARY PAVEMENT GO0 $15.001 $ 4.000.00 $7.00 §4,200.00 $7.50 $4,500.00 $30.00 $16,000.00 $20.00 $12,000.00 $16.00 $6,000.00 $17.00 $10,200.00
17] 254 PAVEMENT PLANING 829 $3.00{ § 2.487 00 $3.75 $3,108.75 $8.80 $7,286.20 $3.18 $2611.35 $11.54 $9.566.66 $10.00 $8,290.00 $10.00 $8.290.00
18] 301 13 BITUMINOUS ACGREGATE BASE 18 545001 § 510,00 $96.00 $1,728.00 $133.00 $2,394.G0 $67 60 §1.576.80 $115.00 $2,070.00 $140.00 $3420.00 $120.00 $2.160.00
19] 304 6" AGGREGATE BASE 132 $45.00| § 5.940.00 $40.00 §5.280.00 $55 00 §7 260 06 $47 50 $6.270 .00 252 00 46 8BB4 OO %50 00 %6,600.00 $EE 00 $7,260.00
201 304 18" AGGREGATE BASE 25 $ 1,500.00 $45.00 $1,125.00 $67.80 $1,696.00 $47 50 $1,187 50 $52 .00 $1,300.00 $42.00 $50.00 $1.250.00
210305 17 PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE BASE - ARTERIAL 789 & 3945000 $22.00 $17 388 00 $21.80 517,042 40 531.00 $24.459.00 $31.00 $24.459.00 L2600 $30.00 82387000
221 AGZ 11 1/2° ASPHALT CONCRETE 5 3 527000 $64.00 $4.224.00 §72.30 $4,771.80 38960 5813.60 £100.04 $6,600.00 $G0.60 $5,940.0 310000 &6 600,00
231 404 11 V4" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COLIRSE 112 5 £,720.00 §66.00 &7,392.00 $74.40 $8,332 89 %5160 $10,259 20 $105.00 $11,760.00 $100.00 311,200.00 $60.00 $10,080.00
241 407 TACK COAT BITUMINOUS 241 b 421.78 $2.00 $482 00 $2.70 $650.70 %2.00 $482 00 $1.25 $301.25 $1.60 $385.60 $2.00 $462.00
25] 409 [SEAL COAT BITUMINOUS MATERIAL 120 $ 210.00 $2.00 $1,080.00 $6.40 $768.00 $3.50 $420.00 %250 $300.60 $5.00 $800 00 $3.00 $360.00
26| 400 1SCAL COAT COVER AGGREGATE 4 $ 7.00 $125.00 $500.00 $186.00 $744.00 §100.00 $400.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $230.00 $920.00 $2060.00 $B00.00
27 452 17" PLAIN PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE PAVEMENT, RIVEWAYS) 44 K 3,300.00 $85 GG $3,740.00 $85.00 §3,.74000 $73.00 $3,212. §73.00 $3,212.00 48000 $3,520.00 570.00 $3,080.00
28] 804 (INLET ADJUSTED TG GRADE 3 1,000 .00 $250.00 $500.00 860,00 $1,120.00 $207 11 £414, $EE0.00 $1,100.00 $160.00 $300.00 5700.00 $1,400 06
291 604 NLET, TYPE AA-3125 H AA-S178 GRATES 1 $ 2.500.00 $1.300.00 $1.300.00 $1.700.00 $1.700.00 £1.034.04 $1,034 04 225000 $2 260.00 $1.800.00 $1.800.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00
G2 604 INLET ODOT CB#3 PER ODOT STD DWG CR-2 1 P4 $ 4.000.00 $1.800.00 $3,600.00 $2.300.00 $4 800,00 $1.480.81 $2.981.02 %2.200.00 §4.400.00 $2.500.00 $5,000.00 $2.000.00 $4,000.00
31 804 IMAMHOLE TYPE C 2 % 5.000.00 $1,700.60 $3,400.00 1.900.00 $3.800.00 $1.146.04 §2 300,00 $4.600.00 $2.700.00 $5.400.00 52.500.00 £5.000.00
32| 805 14" PIPE UNDERDRAN B84 % 4,420.00 $4.50 $3.978.00 5520 $4,596.80 $6.76 $8.50 &7.514.00 §9.00 $7 956,00 §68.00 $7.072.00
33| 607 IFENCE TYPE CL 328 % 782400 £31.00 510,106 .00 £34. 60 $10.398.40 %267 53000 $5,780.00 $26.0G 5647600 $30.00 59 780 01
341 808 14" CONCRETE WALK 2,645 & 11,902 50 $5 50 $14 847 50 $3.40 $8,983.00 £4.00 £4.00 $10.580.00 $14.547 50 56.00 $18,870.00
35/ 608 18" CONCRETE WALK 3,200 38001 § 26,400.00 $6.75 $22,275.00 $4.70 $15,51000 $5 $17,325.00 $20,625.00 $8.00 $26,400.00
38) 608 [CURB RAMP, TYPE A 16 S780.001 § 12,000.00 $100.00 $1,800.00 $412.00 $6,592 00 $230.00 $3.680.00 $4.160.00 $500 00 $8,000.00
371 808 [CURE RAMP, TYPE G 4 $750.00| § 3,000.00 $100.00 $400.00 $412.00 $1,648.00 $230.00 $920.00 $1,040.00 $500.00 $2,000.00
38| 609 |CURB, TYPE 18" STRAIGHT 295 $22.00] § 6,490.00 $20.00 $5,900 00 51580 $4,661.00 $14.20 $4,189.00 $6,195.00 $17.00 $5.015.00
39| 609 STANDARD CONCRETE COMBINED CURB AND GUTTER, PER STD. DWG. 593 5,001 § 8,895.00 $12.00 $7,116.00 $12.20 $7.234.80 $16.90 $10,.021.70 $10,021.70 $11.860.00 $17.60 $10.081.00
40| 609 |BACK OF SIDEWALK CURB, 18" AS PER PLAN 30 $30.00 § $00.00 $32.00 $960.00 $26.80 $804.00 §25.00 $750.00 $750.00 $6870.00 $28.00 $840.00
41] 614 [LAW ENFORCEMENT OFFICER WITHOUT PATROL CAR HOURS 200 $40.001 § 8,000.00 $36.00 $7,200,00 $45.20 $9.040 00 §43.00 $8 600,00 $7,000.00 §7.000.00 $45.00 $9.000.00
42| 614 [LAW ENFORCEMENT OFFICER WITH PATROL CAR HOURS 100 $55.00, $ 5.500.00 $51.00 $5,100.00 $61.20 $6.120.00 $55.00 $5,500.00 $55.00 $5,500.00 $4,000.00 $50.00 $5000.00
431 614 MAINTEMAMCE OF TRAFFIC LUMP, 1 $10,00000| § 10,000.00 $15,600,00 $15600.001  $14 00000 $14,00000] $1502550 $15,02550]  $22.500.00 $22.500.00]  $30,000.00 $30,00000]  $20.000.00 $20.000,00
44| 616 |[WATER GAL 5,000 $0031 8 150.00 $0.10 $500.00 $0.45 $2,250.00 $0.04 $200.00 $9.10 $500.00 $0.10 $500.00 $0.10 $500.00
45| 618 [PIPE ROOF DRAIN, AS PER PLAN LF 40,00 $8.00| § 32000 $14.00 $£60.00 $14.00 $560.00 $12.00 $480.00 $12.00 $480.00 $26.60 $1,040,00 $20.00 $800.00
46; 621 |RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS EA 6 5150001 § 900.00 $180,00 $1,080.00 $186.00 $1,116.00 $183.75 $1,102.50 $175.00 $1,050.00 $350.00 $2,100.00 $332.87 $1,997 22
471 823 JCOMSTRUCTION LAYOUT STAKES LUMP 1 $10,00000) § 10,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $4.000.00 $4,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $5,000.00 £5,000.00]  $10,000.00 $10,000.00
48| €24 MOBILIZATION LUMP 1 $5.000.00; § 5.000.00 $5,000.00 $5.000.00 $8.000.00 $8,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 56,388.59 $6,388.5091  $25000.00 $25.000.00]  $19,000.00 $19,000.00
491 630 'REMOVAL OF GROUND MOUNTED SIGN & DISPGSAL EA 3 515001 % 45.00 $36.00 $108.00 37.20 $111.60 $36.75 5110.25 $35.00 $106.00 $37.00 $111.00 $35,00 $105,00
50 630 |REMOVAL OF GROUND MOUNTED SIGN & REERECTION EA 13 320001 § 320.00 $60.00 $7580.00 $63.80 $829.40 $52.50 $682.50 $60.00 $780.00 $53.00 $688.00 $60.00 $780.00
51] 630 ISIGN, FLAT SHEET SF 13 $15.00] § 195.00 $23.00 $232.00 $23.80 $309.40 $21.00 $273.00 $22.35 $280 55 $21.00 $273.00 $22.36 $290.55
52; 630 1GROUND MOUNTED SUPPORT, NO. 3 POST LF 40 38001 % 320.00 $12.50 $500.00 $12.20 $516.00 $12.75 $510.00 $12.18 $486.00 $12.70 $508.00 $12.15 $486.00
53] 630 |GROUND MOUNTED SURPFORT, NO, 3 POST, AS PER PLAN LF 73 $2.00] § 857 .00 $20.00 $1,460.00 $20.20 51,474.60 $15.75 $1,146.78 $19.00 $1,387.00 $16.00 $1,188.00 $19.00 $1,387.00
541 644 |CHANMNELIZING LINE LF 213 $1.50| § 319.50 $3.00 $639.00 $6.40 $1,363.20 15 $670.95 $3.00 $636.00 %660 $1,405 80 $68.25 $1,331.25
55| 644 |LANE ARROW, 96" EA 1 $100.00| § 100.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $173.25 $173.25 $165.00 $165.00 $530.00 $530.00 $500.00 $500.00
56| 644 WORD ON PAVEMENT, 72" EA 1 $100,00] § 100.00 $200.00 $200.00 $207.00 $207.00 $204.75 $204.75 $195.00 $195.00 $550.00 $550.00 $525.00 $525 .00
57] 653 ITOPSOIL FURNISHED AND PLACED cY 100 $45.00] § 4,500.00 $60.00 $6.000.00 $38.00 $3,800.00 $37.00 $3,700.00 $42.00 $4,200.00 $32.00 $3,200.00 $30.00 $3,000.00
581 659 |WATER GAL 5,000 $0.03| § 150.00 $06.20 $1,000.00 §1.10 $5,500.00 $0.04 $200.00 $0.10 $500.00 $0.08 $250.00 $0.04 $200.00
59! 659 [BEEDING AND MULCHING SY 237 $1.801 § 355,50 $3.00 $711.00 $2.10 $487.70 $2.50 $592.50 $3.75 $688.75 $3.70 $876.90 $2.00 $474.00
60| 805 {CURB BOX EA 1 $640.00| § 640,00 $250.00 $250.00 $70.00 $70.00 $209.7¢ $209.79 $800.00 $800.00 $290.00 $2080.00 $330.00 $330.00
61] 807 [SERVICE BOX, ADJUSTED TO GRADE EA 4 $250.00| $ 1,000.00 $110.00 $440.00 $65.00 $260.00 $251.67 $1,006.28 $725.00 $2,900.00 $270.00 $1,080.00 $206.00 $800.00
62| 807 |HEAVY DUTY VALVE BOX, ADJUSTED TC GRADE EA 5 $200.00] § 1.000,00 $175.00 $875.00 $140.00 $700.00 $150.43 $752.15 $550.00 $2,750.00 $270.00 $1,350.00 $330.00 $1,650.00
63| 809 [FIRE HYDRANT RELOCATED EA 1.0 $2,500.00] 2,500.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $2,681.62 $2,681.62 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,600.00 $2,600.00 $1,200,00 $1,200,00
641 901 [12" PIPE, WITH TYPE 1 BEDDING LF 26 $50.001 § 1,300,00 $55.00 $1,430.00 $23.00 $698.00 $63.78 $1,658.28 $45.00 $1,170.00 $66.00 $1,716.00 $70.00 $1,820.00




Sotder Avenue Improvements

BID TABULATION

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

Columbus Asphalt Paving Inc

Nickolas Savko & Sons

Decker Construction Co

The Shelly Company

Shelly and Sands, Inc

Trucco Construction

BID OPENING DATE: 6/21/2007 1186 Technology Drive 4636 Shuster Road 3040 McKinley Avenue 1771 Harmon Avenue 1515 Harmon Avenue 3046 Home Road
; Gahanna, OH 43230 Columbus, OH 43214 Columbus, OH 43204 Columbus, OH 43223 Columbus, OH 43216 Powell, OH 43065
NO. | ITEM DESCRIPTION UNITS QUANTITY] UNITPRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE| UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE] UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE| UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE| UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
65| 901 {12"PIPE, WITH TYPE 1 BEDDING, WITH ITEM 912 COMPACTED GRANULAR MATERIAL LF 18 $65001 § 1,170.00 $70.00 $1,260.00 $125.00 $2,250.00 $9523 $1,714.14 $58.00 $1.044.00 $75.00 $1,350.00 $110.00 $1,980.00
66) 901 115" PIPE, WITH TYPE 1 BEDDING, WITH ITEM 912 COMPACTED GRANULAR MATERJAL LF 105 $78.00| & 8,190.00 $72.00 $7,560.00 $65.00 $6,825.00 $72.57 $7.619.85 $50.00 $5,250.00 $70.00 $7,350.00 $75.00 $7.875.00
67 210 [PLAIN CONCRETE ENCASEMENT OF 12° DIAMETER PIPE LF 26 $100.00| § 2,600.00 $15.00 $390.00 $10.00 $260.00 $13.58 $352.30 $22.50 $585.00 $40.00 $1,040,00 $20.00 $520.00
68 SPEC |CORE 15" PIPE INTO EXISTING STRUCTURE EA 1 $500.00| $ 500.00 $850.00 $850.,00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $560.00 $560.00 $450.00 $450.00 $400.00 $400.00 $500.00 $500.00
69| SPEC |DETECTABLE WARNING NEW CONSTRUCTION, S8 1551, TYPE E EA 20 $300.00] § 6,000.00 $200.00 $4,000.00 $320.00 $6,400.00 $200.00 $4,000.00 $200.00 $4,000.00 $190.00 $3,800.00 $400.00 $8,000.00
70| SPEC |BOND SIGN EA 2 $700.00| § 1,400.00 $650.00 $1,300.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $918.75 $1,837.50 $650.00 $1,300.00 $925.00 $1,850.00 $650.00 $1,300.00
71] SPEC I TOWING PARKED CARS® EA 2 $100.00) 8 200.00 $52.00 $104.00 $75.00 $150.00 $50.00 $100.00 $45.00 $90.00 $50.00 $100.00 $100.00 $200.00
721 SPEC |STRAW WATTLES™ LE 642 $2.001 1,284 .00 §2.50 $1,605.00 $3.20 $2,054 .40 §1.89 $1.213.38 $2.75 $1,765.50 $2.50 51 605.00 $2.00 $1,284.00
SUBTOTAL $310,658.75 $251,376.25 $262,453.00 $265,100.24 $307,500.00 $316,911.30 $332,702.02
73| SPECIFORCE ACCOUNT (15% OF SUB TOTAL) $46.598 81 $37.706.74 $39,367 .95 $39,765.04 $46,125.00 $47 536.70 $49,905.30
ENGINEER'S TOTAL $357,257.56 $289,084.99 $301.820.85 $304,865.28 $353,625.00 $364,448.00 $382.,607 .32
BIDDER'S TOTAL $289,084.99 $301,820.95 $304,865.28 $353,625.00 $364,447.99 $382,607.32
4] ALT IROLLER COMPACTED CONCRETE, 7% (SUPPLEMENTAL SPECIFICATION 1523) ] sY 789 $47.00| 37,083.00 $45.00| §  35,506.00 $19.20 $15,148.80 no bid no bid no bid no bid $110,00 $86,790.00 $50.00 $39,450.00
Engineer's Total $357,257.56
LOW BIDDER: Columbus Asphalt Paving . $288.084 99
Low bidder based on price only. Does nol include modifications for Quality Contractor calculations Ditference -$68,172 .57

* Contingency guantiies only to be used for bidding only and (o used a8 directed by the City's Transportation Division.
JProject MgtiPre-Construction\062 Bid Tab\Souder Avenue 19928 xis

Thig does not constitule a recommendation for award, it s merely a collection of numbers from the bid opening.




Department of Public Service

CITY OF COLUMBUS
BID EVALUATION FORM

(FOR CONTRACTS OVER $20,000)

1

|

Division: Transportation | _u,.o_mﬁ ‘ Souder Avenue improvements T
] S e . 1 Funding Source: Capital Improvement Budget |
e _ Engineer's Estimate:| $ 357,257.56 Bid Opening Date: 21-Jun-07
o _ Low Bid at Opening:| $ 289,084.99 e
o B ‘ zo:.room_ roi Bid at Opening:| $ - - B o . -
i ) o Company Name:] _ Columbus Asphalt | Nicholas Savko & Sons Decker Construction . The Shelly Company Shelly and Sands Trucco Construction |
- o Original Bid Amount:| § 289,084.99 | $ 301,820.95 | § 30486528 | § 353,625.00 | § 364,448.00 | § 382,607.32
L o o e Local Company? . yes _yes yes | yes ves | o
FACTORS B . . i
M-1 o ] ) / yes . Yes yes
M-2 — ves B . yes yes
-3 . T yes: -  yes ves
M-4 ) no - no no
Eym an Q@w needed) yes | ves yes
bA-6 ,raamﬂ mza nwawommg ac@mg?ﬁo@ have a valid contract ¢ Osm ”m:ﬁ» no 2 m omzaz is attached (yes needed) ves . ves | ves.
- Proceed to Tier 17~ - ) yes, ¥es) yes
 Tierdi- 05&@@.@ Factors (each <mm answer gives H - s ‘
C-1 [ Bidderise , ) ) ' - yes B Y88 . no
c-2 Bidder | _m . e yes, . e BB . YES
-3 : - . yes . ) = o Yes no
C-4 e YES . yes. yes _yes
.5 yes! yes yes| ] .. Yes
Total Credits (cannot exceed $20, 000 per m%a\ Q $100,000 in total) - L ; ‘ 5.00%] 5.00%  3.00%
_ Dolfar Value of Credits - - B 1156340 ' § 8672.55 | $ 11,563.40 | § 11,563.40 * § 1156340 '8 867256
 Bid Total: - o o $ 27752159 $ 293,148.40 | § 293,301.88 1 § 342,061.60 | $ 352,884.60 | § 373,934.77 |
Low Bid Dollar Amount After Credits B $ 27752159 | § 293,14840 | § 293,301.88 | $ 342,061.60 | $ 352,884.60 | § 373,934.77
|
Percent Over Low Bid: T 0.000%, 5631% . Bb86% 23.256% 27.156% 34.741%
Fundamentally Equivalent Bid (.., within 10% of low bid after credits} B Ves! yes yes. ne no no|
Proceed to Tier H? - yes! ves i yes no no o no




. CITY OF COLUMBUS
BID EVALUATION FORM

(FOR CONTRACTS OVER $20,000)

Department of Public Service

Souder Avenue lmprovements

. Division:|  Transportation Project: o
Funding Source: Capital Improvement Buddet ]
B Engineer's Estimate:| $ 357,257 .56 Bid Opening Date: N 21-Jun07
Low Bid at Opening:| § 289,084.99 } I
zo:‘room_ _.92 Bid at Opening:| $ - e ) O S

~ Company Name:

Columbus Asphalt -

_Nicholas Savko & Sons

Decker Construction

The Shelly Company !

Shelly and Sands

Truceo Construction

) Tier Ili - History Experience Factors

‘Bidder has & record of non-compliance with the ,,mocqo_ﬁmﬁ? of :ﬁm O% S m%:ﬁmz,\m action 08@533 ves gives debit no.  no no - -
m&% as a record of non-compliance with ves debit) no } no no, ; B B
m&a? :gm a awm& cq oommm« i M ; no| no . no| . e
no no e e e
o . no e :
- . o o] i
) A Fair rwcﬁ 5t %Qmig Act Qmﬁ gives %,v, w B no: . no no -
B Prevailing Wage Laws Q@w gives debit) ) } i i _Sm
C. Unemployment Compensation Laws ( Qm mzom debit) ) ) ) no no, - )
. S&%Qm Fo%wm:wm o Laws me ) ) nG .
HE-8 Bicder has a record of "willful or "serious” GVI} :.@fmi:a wi o ne o
HE-9 ‘Bidder has a heaith and safety plan that is 83@“@3 with 82@3 ,  yes: ) ) S
zm 10 Bidder qualifies Rm.,m Bureau of Workers Compensation nwi:mz ation mmw 5 “mmm than H.oo (no wzmm debit yes. . i e 5
Im 11 Bidder has a record of Environmental Protection Agency vic ons Emm gives %%v S , no not
HE-12  Bidder has SUpPy oliad tmmawﬁmww% information on last three oe%mﬁmm Qoﬁw (no gi ives debi W T ves yes ) _ .
i Total Negative History and Experience Factors: e . o 0 Ol . -
i A negative score in tier Hi may result in further investigation of bid, if merited o i o S
Bid »nﬂwm:mﬁmﬁ‘ﬁﬁw satisfactory outcome? e U ok — - -
Proceed to Tier IV? i . yes yes yes S .
Tier IV - Resource Factors e | - ]
2.@@, Tier IV entalls examining resource factors of ‘w.mﬁmﬂ spe Do
M:Bc@w %U:nm:az of Tiers t through 1. In Tier IV, a review of %@ %Bm_:_é waamqm Sﬁocam wmoﬁo_\m s be mezgcﬂma following which, the 0_2 will select a contractor (sy). e : ; I
R1__ Bidder has identified adequate equipment for this project (yes gives onie point credit) yes ves yes u B .
R2  Bidder has identified an adequately mxnm:m:nma managerent for this project Qmm @Em.m.c:m point 2@9: yes ) yes yes e i
%m Bidder .jmm identified an adequately expetienced workforce for this project Qmmlmmqmmmg point credit) yes. ) ves _yes ” . )
R4 ‘,mﬁam;am indentified safety personnet for this m"o_nl (yes gives one point credit) Yes: yes yes . o
W\m ) Bidder has identified top five current public or private projects Qﬁmi? in progress (yes ¢ <m@m€zm@_:m credit) Kmm yes yes _ e L :
- Total Number of "Yes" Answers i e
L Has the MBE/FBE subconiractor summary of those within 10% of low bidder prepared? ) w\mm | . S

Division's Recommendation:

Nicholas Mm/%o w mo:m




