ORD 0268-2006

BID TABULATION
40' BUCKET TRUCKS (2)

SA001831

OPENED: 11/17/05

VENDOR ITEM #1 ITEM #2 ITEM #3 ITEM #4 ITEM #5 ITEM #6
Complete Units (2) Fairmont Impact Wrench (2) 8' Tool Hose Kit Bucket Liner Hanging, Inside Basket Step Bucket Mfg. Service Schooling Total Bid Total for items to
NO AWARD RECOMMENDED NO AWARD RECOMMENDED be awarded:

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price ITEMS #1, 2,4 AND 5
Utility Truck Equipment Inc. 85,960.00 171,920.00 1,260.00 2,520.00 300.00 600.00 470.00 940.00 165.00 330.00 1,500.00 1,500.00 $177,810.00 $175,710.00
PO Box 110
23893 US 23 South
Circleville OH
Dueco Inc. 87,830.00 175,660.00 1,236.00 2,472.00 174.00 348.00 411.00 822.00 136.00 272.00 750.00/day 750.00/day $180,324.00 $179,226.00
N4 W22610 Bluemound Rd.
'Waukesha, Wisconsin
Bob McDorman Chevrolet 94,597.78 189,195.56 1,744.00 3,488.00 447.00 894.00 790.00 1,580.00 252.00 504.00 300.00 300.00 $195,961.56 $194,767.56
5885 Gender Road Less Local Credit | LessLocal Credit | LessLocalCredit | LessLocalCredit | LessLocalCredit | LessLocalCredit | LessLocalCredit | LessLocalCredit | LessLocalCredit | LessLocalCredit | LessLocalCredit | Less Local Credit Less Local Credit Less Local Credit
Canal Winchester, OH -878.30 -1,756.60 -12.36 -24.72 -1. -3.: -4, -8.. -1. -2, 7. 7. -$1,803.24 -$1,792.26

93,719.48 187,438.96 1,731.64 3,463.28 445.26 890.52 785.89 1,571.78 250.64 501.28 2925 292.5 $194,158.32 $192,975.30
Byers Chevrolet 97,896.00 195,792.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 695.00 1,390.00 Included w/Liner| Included w/Liner No Bid No Bid $197,182.00 $197,182.00
555 W. Broad St. Less Local Credit Less Local Credit Less Local Credit Less Local Credit (No Bid for Item #2) (No Bid for Item #2)
Columbus, Ohio 43215 -878.30 -1,756.60 -4.11 -8.22

97,017.70 194,035.40 690.89 1,381.78




