

**Bidder Tabulation - Bid #SA006035 - BI006668
Purchase of Luminaires - Opened October 8, 2015**

Bidder Name/Address	Contact Name/#	Pages 1	Pages 2	Pages 3	Pages 4	Pages 5	Signature	C.C. #	Other
Kevin Lehr Associates 1456 Delashmut Ave. Columbus, OH 43212	Kevin Lehr PH: 614-299-8599 Fax: 614-299-8742 Email: klehrkla@aol.com	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Bidder only submitted pricing for line item 17. Bidder provided an attachment of Deco Lighting Model D402
CED (Consolidated Electrical Distributors) 2101 S. High Street Columbus, OH 43207	Michael Luburgh PH: 614-445-8871 Fax: 445-7165 Email: mluburgh@cedcolumbus.com	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Bidder "no bid" on line item 16 and 19. Bidder submitted a Signature Authority letter from the Board authorizing Daniel Nunn to sign Proposal and Contract.
General Supply & Services Inc. dba Gexpro 2803 Charter St. Columbus, OH 43228	William Keane PH: 614-751-3444 Fax: 614-850-2667 Email: william.keane@gexpro.com	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	y	Bidder "No bid" on line items: 8, 10, 11, 16, 19, 24, 25, 28, and 29. Bidder submitted Signature Affidavit and Secretary Certificate.
Graybar Electric 1200 Kinnear Road Columbus, OH 43212	Kris Stough PH: 614-486-4391 Fax: 614-486-0117 Email: kris.stough@graybar.com	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Page 4K "N/Q" was stated on the page. A new Signature Affidavit may be required.
Path Master, Inc. 1960 Midway Drive Twinsburg, OH 44087	Stacia L. Shanley PH: 330-425-4994 Fax: 330-425-9338 Email: sshanley@pathmasterinc.com	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Bidder submitted attachments of products quoted. Bidder "No Bid" on line items: 7, 8, 9, 16, 19, 28, 29, 33, 34, 36, 38, and 39.
Wesco Distribution, Inc. 1255 Danner Dr. Aurora, OH 44202	Jared P. Wackerly II Ph: 330-995-4300 Fax: 330-995-9222 Email: jwackerly@wesco.com	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Bidder submitted a Signatory Authority Delagation, authorizing Branch Managers the authority to sign on behalf of Wesco. Bidder submitted an exception sheet stating the pricing is only valid for 90 days and Kim Lighting items (8, 28 & 29) only valid for 30days.

Power Line Supply Company 1403 Neubrecht Road Lima, OH 45801	Nancy Hoel Ph: 419-227-7575 Ext 2201 Fax: 844-227-7740 Email: nancy_hoel@uscco.com	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Bidder submitted a Signature Authority letter authorizing Dennis Buettner to sign proposals and contracts. Bidder "No Bid" on line items: 8, 13, 16, 19, 28, 29, 33, 34, 36, 38, 39, and 40.
--------------------------------------------------------------------	---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

**Price Tabulation - Bid #SA006035 - BI006668
Purchase of Luminaires - Opened October 8, 2015**

ITEM NO	EST QTY	UNIT	ITEM	Kevin Lehr Associates			CED (Consolidated Electrical Distributors)			General Supply & Services Inc. dba Gexpro		
				UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name
1	75	EA	COBRA 100W 120V HPS, ITEM 3.2.2. DOP #21230				\$ 75.51	\$ 5,663.25	HEL	\$ 76.42	\$ 5,731.50	Cooper
2	200	EA	COBRA 200W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.2.3. DOP #21649				\$ 82.65	\$ 16,530.00	HEL	\$ 84.80	\$ 16,960.00	Cooper
3	20	EA	COBRA 200W 120/240V MT HPS, ITEM 3.2.4. DOP #21651				\$ 85.71	\$ 1,714.20	HEL	\$ 89.70	\$ 1,794.00	Cooper
4	20	EA	COBRA 400W 120/208, 240V/277 V MT HPS, ITEM 3.2.5. DOP #21773				\$ 122.51	\$ 2,450.20	Cooper	\$ 121.27	\$ 2,425.40	Cooper
5	900	EA	COBRA 100W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.2.6. DOP #22105				\$ 75.51	\$ 67,959.00	HEL	\$ 76.42	\$ 68,778.00	Cooper
6	75	EA	CUTOFF COBRA, 100w, 480v, hps item 3.3.2. DOP #21168				\$ 77.55	\$ 5,816.25	HEL	\$ 79.09	\$ 5,931.75	Cooper
7	20	EA	CUT-OFF 250W 480V HPS, BRONZE ITEM 3.3.3. DOP #21712				\$ 354.14	\$ 7,082.80	Cooper	\$ 350.56	\$ 7,011.20	Cooper
8	10	EA	CUT-OFF 400W 480V HPS, WHITE, ITEM 3.3.4. DOP #21771				\$ 867.35	\$ 8,673.50	Kim			
9	20	EA	CUT-OFF 400W 480V HPS, BRONZE, ITEM 3.3.5. DOP #21772				\$ 375.58	\$ 7,511.60	Cooper	\$ 371.78	\$ 7,435.60	Cooper
10	10	EA	RECTANGULAR 250W 480V HPS, BRONZE, ITEM 3.3.6. DOP #21654				\$ 260.20	\$ 2,602.00	HEL			
11	10	EA	RECTANGULAR 400W 480V HPS, BRONZE, ITEM 3.3.7. DOP #21774				\$ 260.20	\$ 2,602.00	HEL			
12	20	EA	low/high mast shepard 480W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.3.8. DOP #21775				\$ 619.80	\$ 12,396.00	Holophane	\$ 625.60	\$ 12,512.00	Holophane

**Price Tabulation - Bid #SA006035 - BI006668
Purchase of Luminaires - Opened October 8, 2015**

ITEM NO	EST QTY	UNIT	ITEM	Kevin Lehr Associates			CED (Consolidated Electrical Distributors)			General Supply & Services Inc. dba Gexpro		
				UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name
13	20	EA	SPHERICAL 70W 480V HPS, BRONZE, ITEM 3.3.9. DOP #22102				\$ 542.85	\$ 10,857.00	Unique Solutions	\$ 547.90	\$ 10,958.00	Holophane
14	10	EA	POST TOP 175W 480V METAL HALIDE BLACK, ITEM 3.3.10. DOP #21968				\$ 605.71	\$ 6,057.10	Holophane	\$ 611.40	\$ 6,114.00	Holophane
15	20	EA	POST TOP 100W 480V HPS, BLACK, ACORN, ITEM 3.3.11 DOP #21176				\$ 535.40	\$ 10,708.00	Unique Solutions	\$ 540.70	\$ 10,814.00	Holophane
16	10	EA	CUT-OFF 250W 480V HPS, BRONZE ITEM 3.3.3. DOP #21712									
17	20	EA	luminaire, aluminum, 100w 480v, HPS, underpass ITEM 3.3.13. DOP # 21583	\$ 215.00	\$ 4,300.00	Deco Lighting	\$ 254.48	\$ 5,089.60	Hel	\$ 296.80	\$ 5,936.00	Holophane
18	25	EA	FLOODLIGHT 250/400W 120V HPS, ITEM 3.3.14. DOP #22028				\$ 134.59	\$ 3,364.75	Cooper	\$ 133.23	\$ 3,330.75	Cooper
19	20	EA	FLOODLIGHT 250/400W 120V METAL HALIDE, ITEM 3.3.15. DOP #22029									
20	20	EA	FLOODLIGHT 250/400W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.3.16. DOP #22030				\$ 134.59	\$ 2,691.80	Cooper	\$ 133.23	\$ 2,664.60	Cooper
21	10	EA	FLOODLIGHT 250W 480V METAL HALIDE, ITEM 3.3.17. DOP #22031				\$ 143.00	\$ 1,430.00	Cooper	\$ 141.58	\$ 1,415.80	Cooper
22	10	EA	FLOODLIGHT 400W 480V METAL HALIDE, ITEM 3.3.18. DOP #22032				\$ 147.95	\$ 1,479.50	Hel	\$ 158.20	\$ 1,582.00	Cooper
23	50	EA	ballast assembly, 400w, 480v. Item 3.4.2 DOP #21822.				\$ 124.89	\$ 6,244.50	Holophane	\$ 126.10	\$ 6,305.00	Holophane
24	10	EA	ballast assembly, 250w 480v, HPS, BRONZE ITEM 3.4.3. DOP #21889				\$ 163.26	\$ 1,632.60	HEL			

**Price Tabulation - Bid #SA006035 - BI006668
Purchase of Luminaires - Opened October 8, 2015**

ITEM NO	EST QTY	UNIT	ITEM	Kevin Lehr Associates			CED (Consolidated Electrical Distributors)			General Supply & Services Inc. dba Gexpro		
				UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name
25	10	EA	ballast assembly, 400w 480v, HPS, BRONZE ITEM 3.4.4. DOP #21890				\$ 137.75	\$ 1,377.50	HEL			
26	20	EA	ballast for 100W 480v HPS teardrop ITEM 3.4.5. DOP #21894				\$ 244.13	\$ 4,882.60	Holophane	\$ 246.40	\$ 4,928.00	Holophane
27	20	EA	ballast for 250w 480v HPS teardrop ITEM 3.4.6. DOP# 21896)				\$ 280.61	\$ 5,612.20	Holophane	\$ 283.20	\$ 5,664.00	Holophane
28	20	EA	BALLAST MODULE 250W 480V HPS, CWA TYPE ITEM 3.4.7. DOP #21898				\$ 311.22	\$ 6,224.40	Kim			
29	20	EA	BALLAST MODULE 400W 480V HPS, CWA TYPE ITEM 3.4.8. DOP #21899				\$ 352.04	\$ 7,040.80	Kim			
30	20	EA	BALLAST MODULE 400W 480V HPS, CWA TYPE ITEM 3.4.8. DOP #21900				\$ 236.78	\$ 4,735.60	Holophane	\$ 239.00	\$ 4,780.00	Holophane
31	750	EA	STARTER, BOARD, 35W THRU 150W item 3.4.10. DOP #21949				\$ 28.10	\$ 21,075.00	Holophane	\$ 28.30	\$ 21,225.00	Holophane
32	100	EA	STARTER, BOARD, 150W THRU 400W item 3.4.11. DOP#21951				\$ 28.10	\$ 2,810.00	Holophane	\$ 28.30	\$ 2,830.00	Holophane
33	10	EA	CONTRACTOR COIL 120V 60 HZ; ITEM 3.4.13. DOP#21158				\$ 84.95	\$ 849.50	Cutler Hammer	\$ 247.00	\$ 2,470.00	Dewbury
34	6	EA	CONTACTOR, 120 AMP, 3-POLE ITEM 3.4.13. DOP #21158				\$ 354.50	\$ 2,127.00	Squareo	\$ 324.00	\$ 1,944.00	Dewbury
35	100	EA	PHOTO CELL CONTROLLER 1000W 1800V, 60 HZ, ITEM 3.4.14. DOP #21560				\$ 3.36	\$ 336.00	DarktoLight	\$ 9.25	\$ 925.00	Fishe Pierce
36	20	EA	PHOTO CELL CONTROLLER 1000W 1800V, 60 HZ, blue item 3.4.15. DOP #21561				\$ 9.75	\$ 195.00	Precision	\$ 9.68	\$ 193.60	Precision

**Price Tabulation - Bid #SA006035 - BI006668
Purchase of Luminaires - Opened October 8, 2015**

ITEM NO	EST QTY	UNIT	ITEM	Kevin Lehr Associates			CED (Consolidated Electrical Distributors)			General Supply & Services Inc. dba Gexpro		
				UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name
37	20	EA	PHOTO Cell Controller 1000W 1800V, 60 HZ yellow item 3.4.16. DOP #21562				\$ 7.15	\$ 143.00	DarktoLight	\$ 20.15	\$ 403.00	Precision
38	10	EA	PHOTOCELL MOUNTING BRACKET, locking type ITEM 3.4.17. DOP #21563				\$ 6.09	\$ 60.90	Precision	\$ 20.90	\$ 209.00	General Electric
39	50	EA	PHOTOCELL, 120 VOLT ITEM 3.4.18. DOP# 22085				\$ 5.50	\$ 275.00	Tork	\$ 18.75	\$ 937.50	Tork
40	2	EA	Breakaway Pedestal Base for controller ITEM 3.4.19. DOP# 22090				\$ 463.15	\$ 926.30	Dewsbury	\$ 518.00	\$ 1,036.00	Dewbury
41	10	EA	FITTER, BALL, FOR TEARDRIP, DARK GREEN ITEM 3.4.20. DOP #21956				\$ 126.37	\$ 1,263.70	King	\$ 141.90	\$ 1,419.00	Holophane
42	175	EA	ACORN GLOBE FOR 100W 480V HPS ITEM 3.4.21. DOP #22095				\$ 265.00	\$ 46,375.00	Holophane	\$ 267.40	\$ 46,795.00	Holophane
43	10	EA	lantern globe for 100W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.4.22. DOP #22096				\$ 73.00	\$ 730.00	Holophane	\$ 73.60	\$ 736.00	Holophane
44	10	EA	BASE ACORN 100W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.4.23. DOP #21174				\$ 383.97	\$ 3,839.70	Holophane	\$ 387.50	\$ 3,875.00	Holophane
			Total	\$ 215.00	\$ 4,300.00			\$ 301,434.85			\$ 278,069.70	

				Price Tabulation - Bid #SA006035 - BI006668 Purchase of Luminaires - Opened October 8, 2015										
				Graybar			Path Master, Inc.			WESCO Distribution, Inc.			Power Line Supply Co	
ITEM NO	EST QTY	UNIT	ITEM	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended
1	75	EA	COBRA 100W 120V HPS, ITEM 3.2.2. DOP #21230	\$ 76.29	\$ 5,721.75	American Electric	\$ 77.00	\$ 5,775.00	American Electric	\$ 77.00	\$ 5,775.00	AEL	\$ 75.48	\$ 5,661.00
2	200	EA	COBRA 200W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.2.3. DOP #21649	\$ 83.50	\$ 16,700.00	American Electric	\$ 84.00	\$ 16,800.00	American Electric	\$ 84.00	\$ 16,800.00	AEL	\$ 82.60	\$ 16,520.00
3	20	EA	COBRA 200W 120/240V MT HPS, ITEM 3.2.4. DOP #21651	\$ 86.60	\$ 1,732.00	American Electric	\$ 87.00	\$ 1,740.00	American Electric	\$ 87.00	\$ 1,740.00	AEL	\$ 86.50	\$ 1,730.00
4	20	EA	COBRA 400W 120/208, 240V/277 V MT HPS, ITEM 3.2.5. DOP #21773	\$ 128.87	\$ 2,577.40	American Electric	\$ 130.00	\$ 2,600.00	American Electric	\$ 130.00	\$ 2,600.00	AEL	\$ 123.65	\$ 2,473.00
5	900	EA	COBRA 100W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.2.6. DOP #22105	\$ 76.29	\$ 68,661.00	American Electric	\$ 77.00	\$ 69,300.00	American Electric	\$ 77.00	\$ 69,300.00	AEL	\$ 75.48	\$ 67,932.00
6	75	EA	CUTOFF COBRA, 100w, 480v, hps item 3.3.2. DOP #21168	\$ 78.35	\$ 5,876.25	American Electric	\$ 79.00	\$ 5,925.00	American Electric	\$ 79.00	\$ 5,925.00	AEL	\$ 77.50	\$ 5,812.50
7	20	EA	CUT-OFF 250W 480V HPS, BRONZE ITEM 3.3.3. DOP #21712	\$ 885.42	\$ 17,708.40	Kim Lighting				\$ 361.00	\$ 7,220.00	Cooper	\$ 357.45	\$ 7,149.00
8	10	EA	CUT-OFF 400W 480V HPS, WHITE, ITEM 3.3.4. DOP #21771	\$ 885.42	\$ 8,854.20	Kim Lighting				\$ 883.00	\$ 8,830.00	Kim		
9	20	EA	CUT-OFF 400W 480V HPS, BRONZE, ITEM 3.3.5. DOP #21772	\$ 885.42	\$ 17,708.40	Kim Lighting				\$ 383.00	\$ 7,660.00	Cooper	\$ 379.10	\$ 7,582.00
10	10	EA	RECTANGULAR 250W 480V HPS, BRONZE, ITEM 3.3.6. DOP #21654	\$ 265.63	\$ 2,656.30	American Electric	\$ 263.00	\$ 2,630.00	American Electric	\$ 265.00	\$ 2,650.00	AEL	\$ 262.65	\$ 2,626.50
11	10	EA	RECTANGULAR 400W 480V HPS, BRONZE, ITEM 3.3.7. DOP #21774	\$ 265.63	\$ 2,656.30	American Electric	\$ 263.00	\$ 2,630.00	American Electric	\$ 265.00	\$ 2,650.00	AEL	\$ 262.65	\$ 2,626.50
12	20	EA	low/high mast shepard 480W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.3.8. DOP #21775	\$ 626.20	\$ 12,524.00	Holophane	\$ 626.00	\$ 12,520.00	Holophane	\$ 631.00	\$ 12,620.00	Holophane	\$ 625.60	\$ 12,512.00

Price Tabulation - Bid #SA006035 - BI006668																																												
Purchase of Luminaires - Opened October 8, 2015																																												
<table border="1" style="width:100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <tr> <th colspan="3"></th> <th colspan="3">Graybar</th> <th colspan="3">Path Master, Inc.</th> <th colspan="3">WESCO Distribution, Inc.</th> <th colspan="3">Power Line Supply Co</th> </tr> <tr> <th>ITEM NO</th> <th>EST QTY</th> <th>UNIT</th> <th>ITEM</th> <th>UNIT PRICE</th> <th>Extended</th> <th>Man. Name</th> <th>UNIT PRICE</th> <th>Extended</th> <th>Man. Name</th> <th>UNIT PRICE</th> <th>Extended</th> <th>Man. Name</th> <th>UNIT PRICE</th> <th>Extended</th> </tr> </table>																		Graybar			Path Master, Inc.			WESCO Distribution, Inc.			Power Line Supply Co			ITEM NO	EST QTY	UNIT	ITEM	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended
			Graybar			Path Master, Inc.			WESCO Distribution, Inc.			Power Line Supply Co																																
ITEM NO	EST QTY	UNIT	ITEM	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended																														
13	20	EA	SPHERICAL 70W 480V HPS, BRONZE, ITEM 3.3.9. DOP #22102	\$ 548.45	\$ 10,969.00	Unique Solutions	\$ 625.00	\$ 12,500.00	Unique Solutions																																			
14	10	EA	POST TOP 175W 480V METAL HALIDE BLACK, ITEM 3.3.10. DOP #21968	\$ 611.96	\$ 6,119.60	Holophane	\$ 509.00	\$ 5,090.00	Holophane																																			
15	20	EA	POST TOP 100W 480V HPS, BLACK, ACORN, ITEM 3.3.11 DOP #21176	\$ 540.93	\$ 10,818.60	Unique Solutions	\$ 541.00	\$ 10,820.00	Holophane	\$ 545.00	\$ 10,900.00	Holophane	\$ 540.40	\$ 10,808.00																														
16	10	EA	CUT-OFF 250W 480V HPS, BRONZE ITEM 3.3.3. DOP #21712	\$ 283.50	\$ 2,835.00	Holophane																																						
17	20	EA	luminaire, aluminum, 100w 480v, HPS, underpass ITEM 3.3.13. DOP # 21583	\$ 297.00	\$ 5,940.00	Holophane	\$ 257.00	\$ 5,140.00	American Electric	\$ 259.00	\$ 5,180.00	AEL	\$ 256.85	\$ 5,137.00																														
18	25	EA	FLOODLIGHT 250/400W 120V HPS, ITEM 3.3.14. DOP #22028	\$ 159.80	\$ 3,995.00	American Electric	\$ 160.00	\$ 4,000.00	American Electric	\$ 137.00	\$ 3,425.00	Cooper	\$ 135.85	\$ 3,396.25																														
19	20	EA	FLOODLIGHT 250/400W 120V METAL HALIDE, ITEM 3.3.15. DOP #22029																																									
20	20	EA	FLOODLIGHT 250/400W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.3.16. DOP #22030	\$ 164.95	\$ 3,299.00	American Electric	\$ 165.00	\$ 3,300.00	American Electric	\$ 137.00	\$ 2,740.00	Cooper	\$ 135.85	\$ 2,717.00																														
21	10	EA	FLOODLIGHT 250W 480V METAL HALIDE, ITEM 3.3.17. DOP #22031	\$ 161.86	\$ 1,618.60	American Electric	\$ 162.00	\$ 1,620.00	American Electric	\$ 146.00	\$ 1,460.00	Cooper	\$ 144.35	\$ 1,443.50																														
22	10	EA	FLOODLIGHT 400W 480V METAL HALIDE, ITEM 3.3.18. DOP #22032	\$ 149.50	\$ 1,495.00	American Electric	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,500.00	American Electric	\$ 151.00	\$ 1,510.00	AEL	\$ 149.35	\$ 1,493.50																														
23	50	EA	ballast assembly, 400w, 480v. Item 3.4.2 DOP #21822.	\$ 126.18	\$ 6,309.00	Holophane	\$ 126.00	\$ 6,300.00	Holophane	\$ 127.00	\$ 6,350.00	Holophane	\$ 126.05	\$ 6,302.50																														
24	10	EA	ballast assembly, 250w 480v, HPS, BRONZE ITEM 3.4.3. DOP #21889	\$ 166.67	\$ 1,666.70	American Electric	\$ 165.00	\$ 1,650.00	American Electric	\$ 166.00	\$ 1,660.00	AEL	\$ 164.80	\$ 1,648.00																														

**Price Tabulation - Bid #SA006035 - BI006668
Purchase of Luminaires - Opened October 8, 2015**

				Price Tabulation - Bid #SA006035 - BI006668 Purchase of Luminaires - Opened October 8, 2015										
				Graybar			Path Master, Inc.			WESCO Distribution, Inc.			Power Line Supply Co	
ITEM NO	EST QTY	UNIT	ITEM	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended	Man. Name	UNIT PRICE	Extended
37	20	EA	PHOTO Cell Controller 1000W 1800V, 60 HZ yellow item 3.4.16. DOP #21562	\$ 23.90	\$ 478.00	Fisher Pierce	\$ 8.00	\$ 160.00	DarktoLight	\$ 6.70	\$ 134.00	AEL	\$ 6.70	\$ 134.00
38	10	EA	PHOTOCELL MOUNTING BRACKET, locking type ITEM 3.4.17. DOP #21563	\$ 12.95	\$ 129.50	General Electric								
39	50	EA	PHOTOCELL, 120 VOLT ITEM 3.4.18. DOP# 22085	\$ 10.44	\$ 522.00	Tork								
40	2	EA	Breakaway Pedestal Base for controller ITEM 3.4.19. DOP# 22090				\$ 265.00	\$ 530.00	Akron Foundry					
41	10	EA	FITTER, BALL, FOR TEARDRIP, DARK GREEN ITEM 3.4.20. DOP #21956	\$ 139.33	\$ 1,393.30	Holophane	\$ 140.00	\$ 1,400.00	Holophane	\$ 141.00	\$ 1,410.00	Holophane	\$ 139.20	\$ 1,392.00
42	175	EA	ACORN GLOBE FOR 100W 480V HPS ITEM 3.4.21. DOP #22095	\$ 267.73	\$ 46,852.75	Holophane	\$ 268.00	\$ 46,900.00	Holophane	\$ 270.00	\$ 47,250.00	Holophane	\$ 267.45	\$ 46,803.75
43	10	EA	lantern globe for 100W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.4.22. DOP #22096	\$ 73.76	\$ 737.60	Holophane	\$ 74.00	\$ 740.00	Holophane	\$ 74.00	\$ 740.00	Holophane	\$ 73.65	\$ 736.50
44	10	EA	BASE ACORN 100W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.4.23. DOP #21174	\$ 387.93	\$ 3,879.30	Holophane	\$ 388.00	\$ 3,880.00	Holophane	\$ 391.00	\$ 3,910.00	Holophane	\$ 387.55	\$ 3,875.50
Total					\$ 333,972.35			\$ 267,320.00			\$ 285,872.00			\$ 259,717.50

ITEM NO	EST QTY	UNIT	ITEM	Company Man. Name
1	75	EA	COBRA 100W 120V HPS, ITEM 3.2.2. DOP #21230	
2	200	EA	COBRA 200W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.2.3. DOP #21649	
3	20	EA	COBRA 200W 120/240V MT HPS, ITEM 3.2.4. DOP #21651	
4	20	EA	COBRA 400W 120/208, 240V/277 V MT HPS, ITEM 3.2.5. DOP #21773	
5	900	EA	COBRA 100W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.2.6. DOP #22105	
6	75	EA	CUTOFF COBRA, 100w, 480v, hps item 3.3.2. DOP #21168	
7	20	EA	CUT-OFF 250W 480V HPS, BRONZE ITEM 3.3.3. DOP #21712	
8	10	EA	CUT-OFF 400W 480V HPS, WHITE, ITEM 3.3.4. DOP #21771	
9	20	EA	CUT-OFF 400W 480V HPS, BRONZE, ITEM 3.3.5. DOP #21772	
10	10	EA	RECTANGULAR 250W 480V HPS, BRONZE, ITEM 3.3.6. DOP #21654	
11	10	EA	RECTANGULAR 400W 480V HPS, BRONZE, ITEM 3.3.7. DOP #21774	
12	20	EA	low/high mast shepard 480W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.3.8. DOP #21775	

				Company
ITEM NO	EST QTY	UNIT	ITEM	Man. Name
13	20	EA	SPHERICAL 70W 480V HPS, BRONZE, ITEM 3.3.9. DOP #22102	
14	10	EA	POST TOP 175W 480V METAL HALIDE BLACK, ITEM 3.3.10. DOP #21968	
15	20	EA	POST TOP 100W 480V HPS, BLACK, ACORN, ITEM 3.3.11 DOP #21176	
16	10	EA	CUT-OFF 250W 480V HPS, BRONZE ITEM 3.3.3. DOP #21712	
17	20	EA	luminaire, aluminum, 100w 480v, HPS, underpass ITEM 3.3.13. DOP # 21583	
18	25	EA	FLOODLIGHT 250/400W 120V HPS, ITEM 3.3.14. DOP #22028	
19	20	EA	FLOODLIGHT 250/400W 120V METAL HALIDE, ITEM 3.3.15. DOP #22029	
20	20	EA	FLOODLIGHT 250/400W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.3.16. DOP #22030	
21	10	EA	FLOODLIGHT 250W 480V METAL HALIDE, ITEM 3.3.17. DOP #22031	
22	10	EA	FLOODLIGHT 400W 480V METAL HALIDE, ITEM 3.3.18. DOP #22032	
23	50	EA	ballast assembly, 400w, 480v. Item 3.4.2 DOP #21822.	
24	10	EA	ballast assembly, 250w 480v, HPS, BRONZE ITEM 3.4.3. DOP #21889	

ITEM NO	EST QTY	UNIT	ITEM	Company Man. Name
25	10	EA	ballast assembly, 400w 480v, HPS, BRONZE ITEM 3.4.4. DOP #21890	
26	20	EA	ballast for 100W 480v HPS teardrop ITEM 3.4.5. DOP #21894	
27	20	EA	ballast for 250w 480v HPS teardrop ITEM 3.4.6. DOP# 21896)	
28	20	EA	BALLAST MODULE 250W 480V HPS, CWA TYPE ITEM 3.4.7. DOP #21898	
29	20	EA	BALLAST MODULE 400W 480V HPS, CWA TYPE ITEM 3.4.8. DOP #21899	
30	20	EA	BALLAST MODULE 400W 480V HPS, CWA TYPE ITEM 3.4.8. DOP #21900	
31	750	EA	STARTER, BOARD, 35W THRU 150W item 3.4.10. DOP #21949	
32	100	EA	STARTER, BOARD, 150W THRU 400W item 3.4.11. DOP#21951	
33	10	EA	CONTRACTOR COIL 120V 60 HZ; ITEM 3.4.13. DOP#21158	
34	6	EA	CONTACTOR, 120 AMP, 3-POLE ITEM 3.4.13. DOP #21158	
35	100	EA	PHOTO CELL CONTROLLER 1000W 1800V, 60 HZ, ITEM 3.4.14. DOP #21560	
36	20	EA	PHOTO CELL CONTROLLER 1000W 1800V, 60 HZ, blue item 3.4.15. DOP #21561	

ITEM NO	EST QTY	UNIT	ITEM	Company Man. Name
37	20	EA	PHOTO Cell Controller 1000W 1800V, 60 HZ yellow item 3.4.16. DOP #21562	
38	10	EA	PHOTOCELL MOUNTING BRACKET, locking type ITEM 3.4.17. DOP #21563	
39	50	EA	PHOTOCELL, 120 VOLT ITEM 3.4.18. DOP# 22085	
40	2	EA	Breakaway Pedestal Base for controller ITEM 3.4.19. DOP# 22090	
41	10	EA	FITTER, BALL, FOR TEARDRIP, DARK GREEN ITEM 3.4.20. DOP #21956	
42	175	EA	ACORN GLOBE FOR 100W 480V HPS ITEM 3.4.21. DOP #22095	
43	10	EA	lantern globe for 100W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.4.22. DOP #22096	
44	10	EA	BASE ACORN 100W 480V HPS, ITEM 3.4.23. DOP #21174	
			Total	

