
From: Wentzel, Steve J.
To: Barnes, Peter D.
Subject: RE: Electric Battery Powered Automated Side Loading Refuse Truck
Date: Thursday, August 4, 2022 2:52:35 PM

Approved.

-----Original Message-----
From: Barnes, Peter D.
Sent: Thursday, August 4, 2022 2:00 PM
To: Wentzel, Steve J. <SJWentzel@Columbus.gov>
Subject: FW: Electric Battery Powered Automated Side Loading Refuse Truck

Steve,
Roblyn is signing off on the revised quote for the EV-ASL purchase, that includes the $102K price increase for surcharges assessed by the
body manufacturer. However, she wants me to forward Department approval from the Director. Can you  please approve the increase?
Tim has approved below.
Thanks,
-Pete

-----Original Message-----
From: Swauger, Timothy J. <TJSwauger@columbus.gov>
Sent: Friday, July 29, 2022 10:21 AM
To: Barnes, Peter D. <PDBarnes@columbus.gov>
Cc: McSweeney, Kevin M. <KMMcSweeney@columbus.gov>; Wentzel, Steve J. <SJWentzel@Columbus.gov>; Slusher, Melvin R.
<MRSlusher@columbus.gov>
Subject: Re: Electric Battery Powered Automated Side Loading Refuse Truck

Yes we are understanding of the price increase and will continue to work for some reimbursement but please move forward.

Thank you

Tim S

> On Jul 29, 2022, at 9:29 AM, Barnes, Peter D. <PDBarnes@columbus.gov> wrote:
>
> ﻿Gentlemen,
>
> Per the email below, Lion is requesting an LOI from the City in order to enter the EV-ASL into production. The LOI has to come from
Purchasing, so before I make that request, I am just confirming that we are ok with the $102,160.10 price increase, revised quote attached
for Steve FYI. I know Kevin has been communicating with CFO regarding the possibility that they may offer some additional funding, but
we need to get this truck in production to avoid more surcharges, and if we want it on the street sometime in 2023.
>
> I can account for any additional grant funding (as determined) in the legislation we will have to do to authorize the increase-->additional
funds, so as mentioned, I just need authorization to get the ball rolling with Purchasing on the LOI.
>
> Let me know if you have any questions, and how I should proceed.
>
> -Pete
>
> From: Joe Gwin <Joe.Gwin@Thelionelectric.com>
> Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2022 9:39 AM
> To: Barnes, Peter D. <PDBarnes@columbus.gov>; Joy Niewiadomski <Joy.Niewiadomski@thelionelectric.com>
> Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Electric Battery Powered Automated Side Loading Refuse Truck
>
> Yes, that date would also be fine. Just send it over when you get a chance and we’ll do what we can!
>
> Thanks,
> Joe Gwin
> National Sales Manager
> Direct line: 518.704.6869
> Cell: 845.418.2188
>
> https://trucks.thelionelectric.com/<https://urldefense.com/v3/__https:/trucks.thelionelectric.com/__;!!J-
4R7rTSYA!b4cj7MfcDtExPwkU1SyeKwrxVfy-cxd7IXnArf1avIkozLzySi-10IhFUtNGLfqDO5lfE8S3D1nos_6jGK6zN2eqCBUK$>
> [cid:image001.png@01D8A32D.A20D3520]
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>
> From: Barnes, Peter D. <PDBarnes@columbus.gov<mailto:PDBarnes@columbus.gov>>
> Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2022 9:28 AM
> To: Joe Gwin <Joe.Gwin@Thelionelectric.com<mailto:Joe.Gwin@Thelionelectric.com>>; Joy Niewiadomski
<Joy.Niewiadomski@thelionelectric.com<mailto:Joy.Niewiadomski@thelionelectric.com>>
> Subject: RE: Electric Battery Powered Automated Side Loading Refuse Truck
>
> *** ATTENTION *** Courriel externe - External email.
>
> Joe,
>
> Thanks for the information. And yes, we can provide a LOI indicating the increase is guaranteed, pending the passage of the legislation
on 9/12/22. We, the Department, cannot guarantee a PO by 9/19/22, because  we cannot control the approval work-flow. Would it be
acceptable to build in a little more cushion, and say PO by 9/23/22? That would ensure all related PO approval work-flow can be
completed. Sometimes the Mayor’s office does not sign off until Friday of the week Council approves the legislation, which would make a
tight window for PO approval by Monday 9/19/22.
>
> Appreciate your help!
>
> -Pete
>
> From: Joe Gwin <Joe.Gwin@Thelionelectric.com<mailto:Joe.Gwin@Thelionelectric.com>>
> Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2022 9:19 AM
> To: Barnes, Peter D. <PDBarnes@columbus.gov<mailto:PDBarnes@columbus.gov>>; Joy Niewiadomski
<Joy.Niewiadomski@thelionelectric.com<mailto:Joy.Niewiadomski@thelionelectric.com>>
> Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Electric Battery Powered Automated Side Loading Refuse Truck
>
> Good morning, Peter.
>
> The first production of the Lion8 refuse truck with your required specifications is expected to begin in September or early October. So
even if you had the approval to increase the PO today, we wouldn’t begin production until then.
>
> However, there could be an advantage to getting in line now. It might put you in line before other orders that are received from now
until late September. We could also inform the body vendor of your intent to purchase. We aren’t expecting a price increase from them,
but we could ask them to hold price until we get your PO for the increased amount.
>
> We typically require something in writing to hold a production slot or start reaching out to vendors. Can you produce a letter of intent,
or some document that guarantees the revised purchase order will be received by September 19th? Without this, it will be difficult for us
to lock anything down. Please let me know.
>
> Thanks,
> Joe Gwin
> National Sales Manager
> Direct line: 518.704.6869
> Cell: 845.418.2188
>
> https://trucks.thelionelectric.com/<https://urldefense.com/v3/__https:/trucks.thelionelectric.com/__;!!J-
4R7rTSYA!c4p0wiMa51l8WxTnMEagmBLduFTLNV7h-
z36j4U8hcNNCvcQFI6gnavuvF_WhXDlT9oI8uSMBPm6o7gIbBpeAWmrdaxS$>
> [cid:image005.png@01D8A19C.B10D2B30]
>
> From: Barnes, Peter D. <PDBarnes@columbus.gov<mailto:PDBarnes@columbus.gov>>
> Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2022 8:18 AM
> To: Joy Niewiadomski <Joy.Niewiadomski@thelionelectric.com<mailto:Joy.Niewiadomski@thelionelectric.com>>
> Cc: Joe Gwin <Joe.Gwin@Thelionelectric.com<mailto:Joe.Gwin@Thelionelectric.com>>
> Subject: RE: Electric Battery Powered Automated Side Loading Refuse Truck
>
> *** ATTENTION *** Courriel externe - External email.
>
> Good Morning Joy,
>
> Following up to see if you were able to discuss this internally, and reach a decision. I will draft the legislation regardless, but to refresh,
Council is on summer recess, and will not return until September 12th. So, pending their approval, the PO will not be increased until the
end of that week, or possibly the week of 9/19/22. The City would like the truck to be in production without any further delays, so
hopefully the existing PO, with pending legislation to accept and appropriate funds for the increase will suffice.
>
> Thank you,
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Quote summary       

Authorized Vendor
This quote is valid for 90 days from quote date. Please refer 

to Payment Terms page for detailed payment terms.

QUO-01943-2 - p.2

EXPERIENCE CENTER LOCATION Quote number QUO-01943
Revision Id 2

Effective From 6/20/2022
New-York Experience Center - 60 Cohoes Ave, Green 
Island NY 12183, suite 102

Effective To 9/18/2022

CUSTOMER INFORMATION
Tim Swauger
City of Columbus, OH
111 N Front Street
Columbus SALES MANAGER INFORMATION
Ohio Joe Gwin
43215 Regional Sales Manager
614-645-7627 4026

Joe.Gwin@Thelionelectric.com

BILLING ADDRESS INFORMATION SHIPPING ADDRESS INFORMATION
111 N Front Street 111 N Front Street
Columbus Columbus
Ohio Ohio
43215 43215
United States United States

Item name Price per Unit Quantity Volume Discount 
Amount

Manual Discount 
Amount

Line Total

2022 Lion8P Refuse - Base Model $385,000.00 1 $0.00 $385,000.00
ASL_220WB_20+5 (25cu. yd) $8,000.00 1 $0.00 $8,000.00
Lion 8P Refuse Base Model Bundle $1,248.00 1 $0.00 $1,248.00
252 kWh_130 miles $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00
DIFFERENTIAL LOCK [Bundle Item] $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
AIR BRAKES [Bundle Item] $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CAB TILT [Bundle Item] $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
DRIVER AIR SEAT [Bundle Item] $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
ELECTRIC HEATER [Bundle Item] $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Option name Price per Unit Quanity Volume Discount 
Amount

Manual Discount 
Amount

Line Total

BUMPERS - BLUE $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00
STANDARD TRACTION TIRES $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00

Equipment $295,572.00TOTAL DEPOSIT DUE AT THE TIME OF 
PURCHASE ORDER PER VEHICLE $0.00

Detail Amount $394,248.00
*The listed taxes and registration fees are estimates only,  fees to be 
calculated at the time of invoice Total Discount -$15,000.00

** Freight charges are estimates only and 
are subject to change at any time. Subtotal $674,820.00

Sales Taxes* %.000 $0.00
Federal Excise Taxes* %.000 $0.00

Environmental fee – Tire * $0.00
Freight Amount** $6,000.00

DMV Registration Fees* TBD
Subtotal with freight and 

taxes
$680,820.00

Total Grants Funding $0.00



Quote summary       

Authorized Vendor
This quote is valid for 90 days from quote date. Please refer 

to Payment Terms page for detailed payment terms.

QUO-01943-2 - p.3

Total Amount $680,820.00

Quote Number: QUO-01943
Revision Number 2

Customer Signature Indicating Acceptance of Quote: 

Purchase Order Number:

Title/Position: 

Date: 

*Note: Price subject to change upon final P.O. acceptance.

*Please note that all funding sources, buying incentives, and grants listed above are only temporary. Amounts shown are subject 
to change based on final order. The client is financially responsible for any discrepancies once the amounts of the award are 

finalized.

           Kathy A. Owens by Roblyn Slaughter

Procurement Admin. Officer

August 5, 2022

Not yet assigned
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