Ord. 2807-2014

From: Klie, Debbie

Sent: Wednesday, November 19, 2014 9:23 AM
To: Popp, Susan J,; Cunningham, Melinda J.
Subject: - FW: $28,875.00 Bill Payment

peborah L. Klie

City Treasurer

90 West Broad Street, 1st Floor
Columbus, OH 43215

Tel: 614-645-7737

Fax: 614-645-3874

From: Crystal Causey [mailto:Crystal.Causey@huntington.com]
Sent: Wednesday, November 19, 2014 9:20 AM

To: Klie, Debbie

Subject: FW: $28,875.00 Bill Payment

Here is the information for this bill payment issue.

From: Adrienne Johnson

Sent: Tuesday, November 18, 2014 6:00 PM
To: Crystal Causey

Cc: Siyveila Davis; Christine Cregar
Subject: $28,875.00 Bill Payment

Crystal, _

Our mutual clients referenced below inadvertently issued bill a payment in the amount of $28,875.00, dated
October 10, 2014. Once our client identified the error, bill pay research case 6311--140CT14 was
launched. We conducted a conference call with our client and City of Columbus customer sexvice
department on October 15, 2014. We discovered that it would take approximately four wecks to refund the
payment back fo the client. Qur client was dissatisfied with the proposed action to rectify

payment. Therefore, we attempted an ACH fransaction reversal on October 17, 2014. Because the payment
was included in our daily Bill Pay EDI file, ACH was unable fo reverse the single transaction from the batch
total. In the meantime, instructions in our ACH reversal request were misconstrued, and consequently our
account was debited $28,875.00. We are requesting assistance in recovering funds.

Should you have additional questions, please feel free fo contact me at 614-331-91 79

DENISE L SKINGLE
NICHOLAS L. MCKAY


mjcunningham
Typewritten Text
Ord. 2807-2014
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7071 GREENLAND PL
DUBLIN OH 43016-7846

Client account debited for bill payment, and later credited.

CTHST  wref i R

~ ACCOUNT: .k_'~g25a,_ezf;;;;::"
- STARTING POST DATE: B i .
"PRODUCT: DDA - SHURT NHHE SKING
SEL  POST DATE = T/C D/C. TRRN HMUUNT -
16/10/2014 5589 D '-. '28,875.00
COLUMBUS CITY PQYMENT 1&10191@31248“'”
10/17/2014 5531 € 28,875.00 _
COLUMBUS CITY REUERSQL 1&101019312&6 _3”48

THST e

“ACCOUNT: :
'STARTING POST DHTE T.
~ PRODUCT: DDR _
SEL POST DATE = T/C D/C TRHN HMOUNT
10/20/2014 5719 DR ; 28,875.00
ACH SETT 14283@0@291 s

Bill Pay Data on file for City of Columbus
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Adrienne Johnson | Process Team Leader | The Huntington National Bank | Phone: 614.331.9179 | huntington.com

This message and any attachments are for the designated recipient only and may contain privileged, proprietary,
or otherwise private information. If you have received it in error, please notify the sender immediately and
delete the original. Any other use of the email by you is prohibited.

- - - Huntington CAN-SPAM Opt-Out Auto-Disclosure - - -
If you prefer not to receive future e-mail offers for products or services from Huntington click or visit
htips://www.huntington.com/unsubscribe






