
Vendor account Line numberTotal amount Quantity Unit price

GE Services 10 4,743.75 25.00 189.75000

Kevin Lehr 10 0.00 25.00 0.00000

Path Master 10 0.00 25.00 0.00000

Utility Supply 10 4,773.00 25.00 190.92000

CED 10 0.00 25.00 0.00000

GE Services 20 8,412.50 50.00 168.25000

Kevin Lehr 20 0.00 50.00 0.00000

Path Master 20 8,600.00 50.00 172.00000

Utility Supply 20 8,421.00 50.00 168.42000

CED 20 8,325.00 50.00 166.50000

GE Services 30 56,495.00 500.00 112.99000

Kevin Lehr 30 0.00 500.00 0.00000

Path Master 30 58,000.00 500.00 116.00000

Utility Supply 30 56,575.00 500.00 113.15000

CED 30 55,955.00 500.00 111.91000

GE Services 40 6,314.00 20.00 315.70000

Kevin Lehr 40 0.00 20.00 0.00000

Path Master 40 0.00 20.00 0.00000

Utility Supply 40 0.00 20.00 0.00000

CED 40 6,308.20 20.00 315.41000

GE Services 50 7,146.00 20.00 357.30000

Kevin Lehr 50 0.00 20.00 0.00000

Path Master 50 0.00 20.00 0.00000

Utility Supply 50 0.00 20.00 0.00000

CED 50 7,140.00 20.00 357.00000



GE Services 60 4,099.80 20.00 204.99000

Kevin Lehr 60 0.00 20.00 0.00000

Path Master 60 4,200.00 20.00 210.00000

Utility Supply 60 4,105.00 20.00 205.25000

CED 60 4,100.00 20.00 205.00000

GE Services 70 35,487.50 1,250.00 28.39000

Kevin Lehr 70 0.00 1,250.00 0.00000

Path Master 70 36,250.00 1,250.00 29.00000

Utility Supply 70 35,525.00 1,250.00 28.42000

CED 70 35,125.00 1,250.00 28.10000

GE Services 80 1,064.70 15.00 70.98000

Kevin Lehr 80 0.00 15.00 0.00000

Path Master 80 1,095.00 15.00 73.00000

Utility Supply 80 1,065.75 15.00 71.05000

CED 80 1,053.00 15.00 70.20000

GE Services 90 60,232.50 225.00 267.70000

Kevin Lehr 90 0.00 225.00 0.00000

Path Master 90 61,650.00 225.00 274.00000

Utility Supply 90 60,300.00 225.00 268.00000

CED 90 59,625.00 225.00 265.00000

GE Services 100 1,475.20 20.00 73.76000

Kevin Lehr 100 0.00 20.00 0.00000

Path Master 100 1,520.00 20.00 76.00000

Utility Supply 100 1,476.60 20.00 73.83000

CED 100 1,460.00 20.00 73.00000

GE Services 110 5,282.28 73.00 72.36000

Kevin Lehr 110 0.00 73.00 0.00000



Path Master 110 0.00 73.00 0.00000

Utility Supply 110 5,314.40 73.00 72.80000

CED 110 5,365.50 73.00 73.50000

GE Services 120 47,640.00 600.00 79.40000

Kevin Lehr 120 0.00 600.00 0.00000

Path Master 120 0.00 600.00 0.00000

Utility Supply 120 47,934.00 600.00 79.89000

CED 120 48,300.00 600.00 80.50000

GE Services 130 5,897.60 76.00 77.60000

Kevin Lehr 130 0.00 76.00 0.00000

Path Master 130 0.00 76.00 0.00000

Utility Supply 130 5,646.80 76.00 74.30000

CED 130 5,586.00 76.00 73.50000

GE Services 140 3,719.00 50.00 74.38000

Kevin Lehr 140 0.00 50.00 0.00000

Path Master 140 0.00 50.00 0.00000

Utility Supply 140 3,742.00 50.00 74.84000

CED 140 3,770.00 50.00 75.40000

GE Services 150 58,499.22 78.00 749.99000

Kevin Lehr 150 0.00 78.00 0.00000

Path Master 150 0.00 78.00 0.00000

Utility Supply 150 0.00 78.00 0.00000

CED 150 58,656.00 78.00 752.00000

GE Services 160 562,472.03 697.00 806.99000

Kevin Lehr 160 0.00 697.00 0.00000

Path Master 160 0.00 697.00 0.00000

Utility Supply 160 0.00 697.00 0.00000



CED 160 564,570.00 697.00 810.00000

GE Services 170 24,209.70 30.00 806.99000

Kevin Lehr 170 16,950.00 30.00 565.00000

Path Master 170 0.00 30.00 0.00000

Utility Supply 170 10,529.40 30.00 350.98000

CED 170 24,270.00 30.00 809.00000

GE Services 180 16,139.80 20.00 806.99000

Kevin Lehr 180 0.00 20.00 0.00000

Path Master 180 0.00 20.00 0.00000

Utility Supply 180 0.00 20.00 0.00000

CED 180 16,180.00 20.00 809.00000

GE Services 190 24,299.70 30.00 809.99000

Kevin Lehr 190 16,950.00 30.00 565.00000

Path Master 190 0.00 30.00 0.00000

Utility Supply 190 11,167.20 30.00 372.24000

CED 190 25,420.50 30.00 847.35000

GE Services 200 0.00 40.00 0.00000

Kevin Lehr 200 0.00 40.00 0.00000

Path Master 200 0.00 40.00 0.00000

Utility Supply 200 10,526.40 40.00 263.16000

CED 200 10,408.00 40.00 260.20000

GE Services 210 0.00 10.00 0.00000

Kevin Lehr 210 0.00 10.00 0.00000

Path Master 210 0.00 10.00 0.00000

Utility Supply 210 2,631.60 10.00 263.16000

CED 210 2,602.00 10.00 260.20000



GE Services 220 12,513.00 20.00 625.65000

Kevin Lehr 220 0.00 20.00 0.00000

Path Master 220 12,800.00 20.00 640.00000

Utility Supply 220 12,536.80 20.00 626.84000

CED 220 12,396.00 20.00 619.80000

GE Services 230 13,012.25 25.00 520.49000

Kevin Lehr 230 0.00 25.00 0.00000

Path Master 230 13,300.00 25.00 532.00000

Utility Supply 230 13,026.25 25.00 521.05000

CED 230 13,147.50 25.00 525.90000

GE Services 240 20,800.00 25.00 832.00000

Kevin Lehr 240 0.00 25.00 0.00000

Path Master 240 25,475.00 25.00 1,019.00000

Utility Supply 240 24,974.00 25.00 998.96000

CED 240 24,625.00 25.00 985.00000

GE Services 250 8,320.00 10.00 832.00000

Kevin Lehr 250 0.00 10.00 0.00000

Path Master 250 10,370.00 10.00 1,037.00000

Utility Supply 250 10,160.00 10.00 1,016.00000

CED 250 9,992.20 10.00 999.22000

GE Services 260 102,575.00 100.00 1,025.75000

Kevin Lehr 260 35,100.00 100.00 351.00000

Path Master 260 104,700.00 100.00 1,047.00000

Utility Supply 260 102,632.00 100.00 1,026.32000

CED 260 101,055.00 100.00 1,010.55000



Comment

DUAL VOLTAGE NOT AVAILABLE NOT MADE ANY LONGER OFFER 400W 

UNIT 4-6 WEEKS ARO COOPER CFB40PWW76U0293

No Quoting this Item

NLA QTG #CFB40PWW76U0293 PULSE START FIXTURE

no quote

6-8 WEEKS ARO HOLOPHANE  AR100HP48PS*111E7R

AR100HP48PS

6-8 WEEKS ARO HOLOPHANE RBK100HP48BP

Per Holophane Part # RBK 100HP 48 B P is quoted

RBK100HP48AP

6-8 WEEKS ARO KIM 85314-480R 250W

No Quoting this Item

NO BID

6-8 WEEKS ARO KIM 85315-480R 400W

No Quoting this Item

NO BID



6-8 WEEKS ARO HOLOPHANE HMS40RHP48

HMS40RHP48

6-8 WEEKS ARO HOLOPHANE EC-3124-KIT

EC3124KIT

6-8 WEEKS ARO HOLOPHANE 4813-B-AC* 186T04

4813BAC

6-8 WEEKS ARO HOLOPHANE GV3C

GV3C

6-8 WEEKS ARO HOLOPHANE 3313-CTN

3313

4-6 WEEKS ARO COOPER OVZ15SP83EU0286



No Quoting this Item

OVZ15SP83EU0286 4-6WKS

4-6 WEEKS ARO COOPER OVZ20SC83EU0286

No Quoting this Item

OVZ20SC83EU1381 6-8WKS

4-6 WEEKS ARO COOPER OVZ10SP83EU0285

No Quoting this Item

11510SCA480R3DGM2NR

4-6 WEEKS ARO COOPER OVH10SP82DU0296

No Quoting this Item

OVH10SP82DU0296 4-6WKS

6-8 WEEKS ARO  KIM 1A/AR2/150HPS480/DB-P/SF/TB

No Quoting this Item

NO BID

6-8 WEEKS ARO KIM 1A/AR3/250HPS480/WH-P/DF-TB

No Quoting this Item

NO BID



6-8 WEEKS ARO KIM HSF/AR3/250HPS480/DB/TB

D815-22-250S-480-T3-2 3/8-DB

No Quoting this Item

TMU25SC83SFBZMS3 4-6WKS

6-8 WEEKS ARO KIM 1A/AR3/400HPS480/WH-P/DF/TB

No Quoting this Item

NO BID

6-8 WEEKS ARO KIM HSF/AR3/400HPS480/DB/TB

D815-22-400S-480-T3-2 3/8-DB

No Quoting this Item

TMU40SC83SFBZMS3 4-6WKS

NO BID

No Quoting this Item

15325SCA480R2DPNR

NO BID

No Quoting this Item

15340SCA480R3DPNR



6-8 WEEKS ARO HOLOPHANE HMST40RHP48S9PS

HMST40RHP48S9PS

6-8 WEEKS ARO HOLOPHANE RP100HP48BG3PS

RP100HP48BG3PS

 8-10 WEEKS ARO  KING K804EGD111250HPS480C/WKPL30GN

ESU250HP48PN4PS

8-10 WEEKS ARO KING K804EGD111400HPS480C/WKPL30GN

ES400HP48B4PS

6-8 WEEKS ARO HOLOPHANE TNLED34K1AHWCRDGRASF2

LED-27100-L6-480-SFM-841-GRY

TNLED34K1AHWCRDGRASF2


