
Purchase of Plow Blades / Parts

Bid # RFQ009489

Opened 7/5/2018

Bidder Name Contact Name/#

10 ft Steel Blade, 

5/8 X 6 X 120 – 

Gledhill Part 

#10FTSPB

11 ft Steel Blade, 

5/8 X 6 X 132 – 

Gledhill Part 

#11FTSPB

Plow Marker 2pk – 

Part #1308110

Plow Screw Adjuster 

– Part #5750A1

HYO Inc. Shelia Kime $119.50 $131.45 $35.50 $54.20

The Dexter Company Al Fulton $60.47 $66.52 $15.53 $23.21

Kueper North America Patricia Schuster No bid No bid No bid No bid

Excenture Business Solutions John Wooldridge $89.00 $98.00 $17.00 $45.00

EXTENDED

HYO Inc. $11,950.00 $13,145.00 $1,775.00 $2,710.00

The Dexter Company $6,047.00 $6,652.00 $776.50 $1,160.50

Kueper North America

Excenture Business Solutions $8,900.00 $9,800.00 $850.00 $2,250.00

Bidder Tabulation



Screw Handle – Part 

#351C
Shoe Post – Part 

#3546B

Mushroom Plow 

Shoe - #SP185

Moleboard Shoe – 

Part #13282C

Curb Shoe – Part 

#1301815

Kueper GK5 3ft 

Rubber Blade – Part 

#348558507

Kueper GK5 4ft 

Blade – Part 

#348559507

$51.65 $120.10 $85.90 $91.20 $62.40 $577.00 $770.00

$19.27 $47.54 $61.92 $68.20 $17.43 $427.46 $569.93

No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid $405.00 $540

$42.00 $90.00 $64.00 $68.00 $18.00 $431.00 $575.00

$1,549.50 $6,005.00 $8,590.00 $18,240.00 $9,360.00 $25,965.00 $34,650.00

$578.10 $2,377.00 $6,192.00 $13,640.00 $2,614.50 $19,235.70 $25,646.85

$18,225.00 $24,300.00

$1,260.00 $4,500.00 $6,400.00 $13,600.00 $2,700.00 $19,395.00 $25,875.00

380.09

204.97

Bidder Tabulation



Kueper Curb Guard 

Left Side – Part 

#GK5SWAL

Kueper Curb Guard 

Right Side – Part 

#GK5SWAR

Mushroom 

Assembly – Part 

#7230A11

Plow Pin – Part 

#13688-A

$212.00 $212.00 $540.00 $12.20

$156.87 $156.87 $189.90 $15.07

$120.00 $120.00 No bid No bid

$158.00 $158.00 $403.00 $9.00

$3,180.00 $3,180.00 $10,800.00 $122.00 $151,221.50

$2,353.05 $2,353.05 $3,798.00 $150.70 $93,574.95

$1,800.00 $1,800.00 $46,125.00

$2,370.00 $2,370.00 $8,060.00 $90.00 $108,420.00



Purchase of Plow Blades / Parts

Bid # RFQ009489

#REF! #REF!

Opened 7/5/2018

ITEM NO EST QTY UNIT ITEM

 UNIT 

PRICE 

Price Tabulation




