
ORD #0482-2019; CV18-075; Page 1 of 7

slpine
Typewritten Text
CV18-075
Final Rec'd 3/29/2019

slpine
Typewritten Text



Statement of Hardship 

The purpose for this application is for the Urban Land Co. to construct a 3-story apartment building, 
hereafter referred to as the Gay Street Apartments, at the corner of East Gay Street and North 18th 
Street located within the Near East Area Commission.  This project will ultimately result in the 
construction of 25 additional units of contemporary metropolitan housing designed for single occupants, 
with readily available access to public transportation in this growing area of the City.  With the site’s 
location central to the City, access to public transportation, and the ongoing construction of similar 
housing in the immediate vicinity, the site is an ideal candidate for this proposed development. 

The proposed development, and thus the proposed variances, will cover four (4) separate properties 
and a small portion of existing right-of-way to be vacated between Almond Avenue and E. Gay Street 
abutting N. 18th Street.  All parcels currently exhibit the same zoning and the Applicant is currently in 
the process of combining the parcels into one.  The current parcel numbers are as follows:  

010-047843, 010-050496, 010-052096, 010-055564 

Multiple variances are currently proposed for the site, currently zoned under R2-F Residential, in order 
to permit a development of this scope and density in this up-and-coming neighborhood.  In detail, the 
variances required for this proposed development are as follows: 

Section 3312.21(A) – Parking Lot Landscaping 

 To eliminate 3 tree islands in the parking lot and instead provide them in the perimeter of the 
 parking lot as shown on the plan. 

Section 3312.21(D) – Parking Lot Screening 

To reduce the parking lot buffer from 4 feet in width to 0 feet along the north property line. 

To maintain adequate traffic circulation and due to site constraints the applicant is to provide screening 
adjacent to the parking lot area in the R-O-W of Almond Alley. 

Section 3312.49(C) – Minimum number of parking spaces required. 

To reduce the number of required onsite parking spaces. 

The code requires 1.5 spaces per dwelling unit, which would total 38 parking spaces.  The proposed site 
plan provides one space per dwelling unit for a total of 26 parking spaces.  Due to the nature of the 
development the units are designed for single occupants and each unit would be allotted one parking 
space.  On-street parking is available on East Gay Street to meet any additional needs of the tenants.  
Due to site constraints the additional 13 spaces would be a hindrance to the traffic circulation, require 
reduced parking space dimensions, create excess paved and impervious surface area, and be 
unnecessary for the perspective tenants.    

Section 3332.25 – Maximum Side Yard Required 

 To reduce the maximum side yard to 15.04 feet (5.64’ at the dumpster + 9.4’ at the NW Corner 
of the building).   

The code requires the sum of the widths of the side yard to be 16-feet.  To accommodate a garbage 
dumpster in a location accessible to refuse collection, we are requesting a reduction to 15.04’.   
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Section 3332.037 – R-2F Residential District Permitted Use 

To allow the construction of a 25-unit apartment building in an R-2F district. 

Due to the higher density of units associated with multi-story apartment buildings exceeding that of a 
single-family or two-family dwelling, a variance is being sought to allow higher density housing than 
permitted by code within the R-2F zoning district. 

 

Section 3332.21 – Building Line   

To reduce the Front Building Setback from 10’ to 7.5 feet. 

The proposed building would be aligned with the property to the east which would maintain the urban 
nature of the neighborhood.  The frontage would still provide pedestrian access and greenspace which 
imitate the “urban density” philosophy of the North East Area Plan. 

Section 3332.29 – Height District   

To increase the allowable building height of 35 feet to 41.5 feet. 

The goal of the proposed development is to provide a modern compact unit to the individual resident 
with unique features, one of which is providing 10-foot-high ceilings.  In doing so the 3-story building 
height would extend beyond the allowable height by 6.5 feet with minimal impact to the surrounding 
area.  Three stories is compatible with other developments on the same block, and the height variance 
allows the project to incorporate a pitched roof, which is in keeping with the context and character of 
the surrounding neighborhood.   This variance is not necessary to allow for three floors, which can be 
accommodate within the 35’ limit.  This variance is being sought to allow for appropriate higher quality 
architecture and higher quality interior space.  

The aforementioned variances are all integral to the success of the project and the ultimate goal of 
constructing additional affordable, multi-family housing in this growing neighborhood.  The proposed 
variances would be well supported in the character of this neighborhood.  The Application respectfully 
requests the support of, and approval of, this variance request. 

 

 

___________________________                       _____________ 

Applicant Signature    Date 

03/29*/2019
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SITE 

 
CV18-075 

932 East Gay Street 
Approximately 0.41 acres 
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