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BACKGROUND:
Chapter 3312 of the Columbus Zoning Code, Title 33, regulates Off-Street Parking and Loading. These regulations were
last reviewed and overhauled in 2010 with the passage of Ordinance No. 1536-2009.

The code changes contained in this ordinance will update and continue to modernize the Columbus Zoning Code
regulations regarding off-street parking and loading by adding code language to better contend with existing situations
and situations where parcels cannot be combined due to differing taxing districts. These code changes also add language
related to prohibited parking, and clarifies the requirements for stacking spaces, pedestrian circulation routes, parking in a
driveway, landscaping, and screening. Additionally, these code changes address parking for office uses in the Short North
Special Parking Area.

Further, minor adjustments are made to the minimum number of required off-street parking spaces for specified uses
while the list of specified uses is added for clarity. Finally, these code changes streamline the requirements for bicycle
parking by removing the design standards that are already regulated by the Department of Public Service. Overall, these
code changes will make regulating, applying, and enforcing the provisions of Columbus City Code Chapter 3312, “Off-
Street Parking and Loading” easier and more efficient, while also ensuring a consistent approach for all users of the
zoning code.

A public hearing was held before the Columbus Development Commission on June 8, 2023, and presentations to the
Victorian Village Commission and the Italian Village Commission are being made at each of their respective business
meetings in late June.

FISCAL IMPACT:
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No funding is required for this legislation.

To repeal and replace various sections in Chapter 3312, “Off-Street Parking and Loading” of the Columbus City Codes in
order to update and modernize the minimum number of off-street parking and loading spaces required by code, and to
update overall off-street parking and loading space regulations.

WHEREAS, the code changes contained in this ordinance will update and continue to modernize the Columbus Zoning
Code regulations regarding off-street parking and loading by adding code language to better contend with existing
situations and situations where parcels cannot be combined due to being located in differing tax districts; and

WHEREAS, the code changes also add language related to prohibited parking and clarifies the requirements for stacking
spaces, pedestrian circulation routes, parking in a driveway, landscaping, and screening requirements; and

WHEREAS, additionally, the code changes also address parking for office uses in the Short North Special Parking Area;
and

WHEREAS, further, minor adjustments are made to the minimum number of required off-street parking spaces for
specified uses while the list of specified uses is amended  for clarity; and

WHEREAS, these code changes also streamline the requirements for bicycle parking by removing the design standards
that are already regulated by the Department of Public Service; and

WHEREAS, overall, these code changes will make regulating, applying, and enforcing the provisions of Columbus City
Code Chapter 3312, “Off-Street Parking and Loading” easier and more efficient, while also ensuring a consistent
approach for all users of the zoning code; and

WHEREAS, a public hearing was held before the Columbus Development Commission on June 8, 2023, and
presentations are being made to the Victorian Village and Italian Village commissions in June, and these proposed code
changes are fully supported by these commissions for adoption by Columbus City Council; NOW, THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF COLUMBUS:

SECTION 1. Council finds and determines that for the general health, safety and welfare of the City and its residents,
certain sections of Chapter 3312 “Off-Street Parking and Loading” of the Columbus City Code, are amended as identified
in Exhibit “A”, attached hereto and incorporated herein, with additions underlined and deletions stricken. In furtherance
thereof, existing sections 3312.01, 3312.03, 3312,051, 3312.053, 3312.07, 3312.09, 3312.11, 3312.13, 3312.21, 3312.23,
3312.25, 3312.27, 3312.29, 3312.30, 3312.31, 3312.33, 3312.35, 3312.37, 3312.41, 3312.43, 3312.49, 3312.53, and
3312.56 of the Columbus City Code are hereby repealed.

SECTION 2. All sections of Chapter 3312 not repealed or amended as identified in Exhibit “A” with deletions stricken
and new language underlined, remain unchanged and enforceable.

SECTION 3. That this Ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after the earliest date allowed by law.
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